Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[] Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[1 Paving Fund (PAV)

! Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler

| Amount: $4,081.00 Date: January 11, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Seven metal trash receptacles @$583.00 per unit for the Wilder Park
Neighborhood.

- City Agency:  Solid Waste
Contact Person;  Steve Fenster

Agency Phone: 502-574-8116

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a pup ¢ purpose. (/:7
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Interagency Name: - Solid Waste Management v
Program/Project Name: Metal Trash Receptacles-Wilder Park
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Réquest Sivg'ned by all Council Member‘(ys) N

- Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be uséd, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

’ Request Form: If matching funds are to be uSed, does the amount of the :
request exclude the matching fund amount? ~ NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this p"rojevc‘t, are they '
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: IfCIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is No
probably NDF,

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than -
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. ~ NA
Ordinance Required: Is the req‘ue‘st a transfer from NDF to cost center? If '
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: ‘Does the attachment include a valid estimate v

es

and description of cost?

Prepared by;‘ - ,Daté;,f,Jaﬁuary11;2d16,

m
Effective July 2015




Luckett, Daniel R

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: - Monday, January 11, 2016 7:47 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R

Cc: Hackett, Keith; Baldon, Antonio J Sr; Hughes, Susan
Subject: RE: Permanent trash containers

We will accept funds totally $4,081.00 for decorative trash cans for the Wilder Park Neighborhood project.

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Friday, January 08, 2016 12:17 PM

To: Fenster, Steve A

Cc: Hackett, Keith; Baldon, Antonio J Sr; Hughes, Susan
Subject: FW: Permanent trash containers

Mr. Fenster,
Please send me an email or answer this one stating that Solid Waste Management will accept payment for 7 new metal trash

receptacles, at a cost of $583.00 per unit (Total = $4,081.00) The name on the receptacles should read “Wilder Park
Neighborhood”. Thank you!

Daniel Luckett, Jr.
Administrative Clerk District 15
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
office-502-574-1115
fax-502-574-4455




