Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
O Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
O] Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
D Paving Fund (PAV)
I Primary Sponsor: Dan Johnson
| Amount: $456.96 Date: 1/13/16

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

fabrication and installation of two signs recognizing the 6-A State Football
Championship team from Louisville Male High School.

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets
Contact Person:  Bonnie Roades

Agency Phone: 502-574-3091

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax doliars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

21 ‘\/\ N /[/¥ $456.96 1-13-15
District # Counef'\Meémbe ignature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




Interagency Name:  Puplic Works & Assets - signage department |
Program/Project Name: fabrication and installation of championship signs
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they‘d‘iscloséd with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville ownk/will
- own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding sourceis NA
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is beihg requested, does the projéct have a useful ;
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
: Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greafer than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
- 50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

~and description of cost?

Effective July 2015




Mathews, Bryan L

From: Graves, Derek

Sent: Wednesday, January 13, 2016 8:56 AM

To: Sparks, Stuart; Mathews, Bryan L; Hall, Barbara C

Cc Slaughter, Kenneth G.

Subject: RE: Male HS sign

By Stuarts assessment and specifications, the total price for this project will be $ 456.96.

If this is acceptable please provide billing information and or a cost center.

Once we have that we will create a work order and send it to Fabrication. N

Beyond that, you're looking at about a month before it could be installed. Thanks

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Wednesday, January 13, 2016 8:12 AM
To: Mathews, Bryan L; Hall, Barbara C

Cc: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Graves, Derek
Subject: RE: Male HS sign

Bryan,

Attached you will find the proposed installation locations plan. Please let us know if you need anything else.
Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings

601 W Jefferson St, Room 8
(502) 574-3650

From: Mathews, Bryan L

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2016 3:22 PM

To: Hall, Barbara C

Cc: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Graves, Derek; Sparks, Stuart
Subject: RE: Male HS sign

How much is the larger sign design going to cost?

From: Hall, Barbara C

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2016 3:21 PM

To: Mathews, Bryan L

Cc: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Graves, Derek; Sparks, Stuart
Subject: RE: Male HS sign

Yes, I'm well aware of it. | fabricated it. ;)




Mathews, Bryan L

From: Hall, Barbara C

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2016 2:13 PM

To: Mathews, Bryan L

Cc: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Graves, Derek; Sparks, Stuart
Subject: RE: Male HS sign

That’s enormously helpful, Bryan!! Thank you muchly, LOL!

So, try this one on for size:

Kentucky State 6-A Football
*Note that | drew this up as a 48x24” but it can scaled to fit a 60x30” panel (or reconfigured for another size if you like).

BC (Barbara) Hall, Sign Tech
Louisville Metro Public Works
Division of Signs & Markings
1450 Lexington Rd

Louisville, KY 40206

(502) 574-3251

PHEPARYMENT OF

PUBLIC WORKS

Fogrs B Mg

From: Mathews, Bryan L

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2016 10:38 AM
To: Hall, Barbara C; Sparks, Stuart

Cc: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Graves, Derek
Subject: RE: Male HS sign

All = The Male HS Athletic Director sent me the attached logo a couple days ago. My bad for failing to pass it along.

Male won the 6-A football championship. Is it possible to include also that they were undefeated with a record of 15-0?
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