Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request £

[0 Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[0 Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

LPrimary Sponsor: David Tandy l

| Amount: $34216.64 Date: 12/9/2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Alley paving that runs north-south between Rogers Street and Payne Streets,the
alley that runs east-west between Baxter Avenue and Rubel Ave, and the alley
that runs behind 770 Logan Street.

$8783.66 (Council Alley Paving) 410 8210 148250 822702
$34216.64 (PAV) 410-8105-148946-8127-822804
Total= $43,000

City Agency:  Public Works
Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 502-574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

4 A ; \ ' k $34,216.64 12/19/2015
District # Council Member Signa\‘r_u:y Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: - Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Ppyblic Works
Program/Project Name: Alley Paving for Logan Street, Roger and Payne & Baxter Avenue and Rubel Ave

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is NA
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

and description of cost? Yes

Prepared by: Kb\(),m L\ V\@ Date: 12/9/2015
\

Effective July 2015



King, Keidra

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2015 4:56 PM
To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: alley pavng

Keidra,

The cost to resurface the alley bordered by Baxter Ave, Payne Street, Rogers Street and Rubel Avenue would be $25,000.

e —————
P = ——

Thanks,
Andrew

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 9:21 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: Fwd: alley pavng

Hello Andrew, can you please give me a price estimate of the request below. Thanks!
Yours In Service,

Keidra D.C.King

Chief of Staff

President David W. Tandy
Louisville Metro Council
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Please excuse any typos
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Rob Haynes <robertmhaynes(@yahoo.com>
Date: November 30, 2015 at 3:24:42 PM EST

To: Keidra King <keidra. king@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: alley pavng

Reply-To: Rob Haynes <robertmhaynes(@yahoo.com>

Hi Keidra,

This message is to respectfully request repaving of the alley that run north-south between Rogers Street and
PayneStreets and the alley that runs east-west between Baxter Avenue and Rubel Ave.

Thanks to Councilman Tandy for his consideration.

Rob Haynes
Sent from my iphone



King, Keidra

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2015 2:15 PM
To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: alley pavng

PW will accept the funding.

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2015 11:55 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: alley pavng

Please confirm that you will accept this funding from District four.

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2015 4:56 PM
To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: alley pavng

Keidra,
The cost to resurface the alley bordered by Baxter Ave, Payne Street, Rogers Street and Rubel Avenue would be $25,000.

Thanks,
Andrew

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 9:21 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

“Subject: Fwd: alley pavng

Hello Andrew, can you please give me a price estimate of the request below. Thanks!
Yours In Service,

Keidra D.C.King

Chief of Staff

President David W. Tandy
Louisville Metro Council
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Please excuse any typos
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:



From: Rob Haynes <robertmhaynes@yahoo.com>
Date: November 30, 2015 at 3:24:42 PM EST

To: Keidra King <keidra.king@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: alley pavng

Reply-To: Rob Haynes <robertmhaynes@yahoo.com>

Hi Keidra,

This message js to respectfully request repaving of the alley that run north-south between Rogers Street and
PayneStreets and the alley that runs east-west between Baxter Avenue and Rubel Ave.

Thanks to Councilman Tandy for his consideration.

Rob Haynes
Sent from my iphone



King, Keidra

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 7:44 AM

To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: follow-up

Keidra,

The cost to pave that alley is $18,000. If you have any other questions, please let me know.
Thanks,

Andrew

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Monday, November 30, 2015 11:58 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: follow-up

Hello Andrew,

I wanted to touch base regarding an alley paving that our office requested. We are trying to get a price estimate to see
how much it would cost to pave the alley behind 770 Logan Street.

Yours in Service,

Keidra D.C. King

Metro Council District Four
Councilman David Tandy
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Office: 502.574.1104

SNy

*All meeting and public appearance request should be sent to Districtd@Iouisvilleky.qov *

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Monday, November 09, 2015 8:05 AM
To: King, Keidra

Cc: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: follow-up

Keidra,

Just to confirm, the $10,000 is to complete the curb repairs from 12" & Broadway to 13" & Market? If so that is great
news.

Andrew Metcalfe is responsible for paving, | have copied him to help you with your estimate request,

1



Thanks,

haiy AHlen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office. (502) 574-6159

Fax. (502) 574-4129

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Saturday, November 07, 2015 2:16 AM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: follow-up

Hello Craig,

President Tandy has agreed to give an additionally $10,000 to finish the side walk. Also, can you please get me a price
estimate for an alley pavement? It is the alley behind 770 Logan Street.

Thanks in advance.



Louisville Metro Council

President David W. Tandy

To whom it may concern:

[ 'have given Keidra King permission to sign for me for the following NDF and CIF Projects.

Alley paving Project: $43,000
JCPS §3,500

10 decorative trash receptacles and liners $7,230

Sincerely,

David W. Tandy
President of the Louisville Metro Council

601 West Jefferson Street » (502) 574-1104 Louisville, KY 40202
David.Tandy@LouisvilleKy.gov



