Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

oo™ d

] Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

[ Amount: $15,000 Date: March 11, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Parks to repair tennis courts at Seneca Park. Partnership project
with Parks and United States Tennis Association (USTA). Total estimated repairs
to cost $62,000 with USTA providing $20,000.

City Agency:  Metro Parks
Contact Person: Marty Storch

Agency Phone: 458-0778

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a pl?ljcﬂpur ose ,
9 W \ $15,000 03/15/16

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: \ Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

~ Revised July 2015



Ethridge, Kyle

From: Storch, Marty

Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 2:59 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: RE: Seneca Park tennis courts

Glad to do so — thanks.

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 2:10 PM
To: Storch, Marty

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: Re: Seneca Park tennis courts

Thanks for the update! Can you send an email that you accept oyr’$15,000 aid | can process?

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 | 0: (502) 574-1109

On Mar 11, 2016, at 2:00 PM, Storch, Marty <Marty.Storch@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

From: Hollander, Bill H.

Here is best news | can give. USTA has now given us their $20k check. We have met on site to discuss
work with contractor and they believe this work will be completed before spring ends and summer
begins. Their ultimate goal is before school is out for summer break which typically is around first week
of June. | hope this heips and we greatly appreciate your participation which will be a much improved
solution until courts can be completely overhauled at some future date. Thanks again and have a great
day.

Sent: Wednesday, March 09, 2016 9:31 PM
To: Storch, Marty

Cc: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: Re: Seneca Park tennis courts

Nope. That was a Mr. Peters. Lots of tennis lovers!

(NOTE: if you didn't, please be sure to copy my Legislative Assistant, Ms. Kyle Ethridge, on all emails to
me. Her email is: kyle.ethridge@louisvilleky.gov)

Councilman Bili Hollander
Ninth District Councilman
601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-1109

On Mar 9, 2016, at 9:13 PM, Storch, Marty <Marty.Storch@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:




interagency Name: pMetro Parks

Program/Project Name:

- Request Form: Is the Request S:gnedbyaIICouncn Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Réquest Form: |If matchihg funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

| Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Requést Form: If other funds are to be used for this prbjéct, are théy
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

' Funding Source: If CIF is beking réquested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

' Fuynd'ing Source: If CIF is being requested, does thekprbjéc“‘tﬂhave a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

| Ordinance Requiréd: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required.

' Ordinance Required: Isthe request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
- s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

' Supportihg Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

SenecaPark fennis Courts Rép;éir
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- and description of cost?

Effective July 2015




