Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

oo O

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

I Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

! Amount: $1,000

Date: March 15, 2016

Avenue. Total project is $14,000.

Description of pregram/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Public Works for removing sidewalk tripping hazards on Hillcrest

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a pyhli¢ purpose.
9

$1,000 03/15/16
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Amended Amount:

To OMB:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




Ethridge, Kyle .

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 3:.09 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: Paving Project

Kyle,

We are going to do two waves of repairs on one of these roads, Hillcrest Ave. We are going to use Precision Concrete
Cutting (PCC) first to remove as many repairs as they can. Then we are going to remove and replace the trip hazards
that are left. Would you label this appropriation “Removing Sidewalk Trip Hazards on Hillcrest Ave” so that | have the
flexibility to use this money on either the first or second wave? PCC will begin tomorrow and the appropriation may not
come through in time to pay their invoice.

MPW will receive this money.

Thanks!
Craig

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 11:11 AM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: Paving Project

Craig,

the Hillcrest and Pennsylvania sidewalks. Will MPW accept

OIC

We are low on funds this year, but we can do $1,000 towa

the $1,000 for the project?

Thanks,
Kyle

»-

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews!




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Allen, Craig L.

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 4:04 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: Paving Project

| just figured out a way to use the 51,000 only on PCC regardless of when the appropriation is finalized. It will cost
approximately $6,910 to remove sidewalk trip hazards from Hillcrest Ave using Precision Concrete Cutting. Public Works
will fund $5,910 and the contributions from Council District 9 will cover the remaining $1,000.

Thank you for your patience,

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office. (502) 574-6159

Fax. (502) 574-4129

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 3:58 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Paving Project

Got it — can you please send me an estimate for repairs that | can include with the request?

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
 Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews!

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 3:57 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: Paving Project

{ would just spend the $1,000 Council Hollander will appropriate removing trip hazards on Hillcrest Ave.

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5" Street, Suite 400



Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Removing sidewalk tripping hazards on Hillcrest Avenue
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed By all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: |If matchin‘g funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

~account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Reduest Form: If other funds are to be used for this"broject, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested; does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being ‘requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than o
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v

es

and description of cost?

Effective July 2015




