Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

OO0

| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $1,710 Date: March 24, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Brightside for median on Lexington Road at Ledge Road. $960 for tree &
stump removal, pick-up & plantings of 5 trees, and weed entire median. $750 for
one-year of maintenance by Brightside after installation of trees and ground cover.

City Agency:  Brightside
Contact Person:  John Backert

Agency Phone: 574-3937

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose.
9 Zy @W—\ $1,710 03/24/16

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Brightside

Program/Project Name: Lexington and Ledge Median

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request'Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they '

NA

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIFis being r'eﬂquested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is NA
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: |s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Prepared by: m 0(3/ Date: March 24, 2016

Effective July 2015



Ethridge, Kyle

From: Backert, John M

Sent;: Thursday, March 24, 2016 1:18 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Michael; OBrien, Gina I.
Subject: RE: Ledge/Lexington Road Median

Yes. That wili be acceptable. | look forward to getting this site in and planted.
Thanks,

John Backert

Brightside - Landscape Coordinator

Louisville Forward — Develop Louisville

527 West Jefferson Street, 6 floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone 502 574-3937

John.backert@louisvilleky.gov

STAY CONNECTED TO BRIGHTSIDE

AC»E

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, March 24, 2016 1:14 PM
To: Backert, John M

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Michael; OBrien, Gina I.
Subject: Ledge/Lexington Road Median

John,

Will Brightside accept $750 from D9 office for one-year of maintenance including watering and weeding for the median at
Ledge/Lexington Road?

Thank you, @ K/ (
T

Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant W
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202

d: (5602) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews!



Ethridge, Kyle

From: Michael <mhayman@iglou.com>
Sent: Monday, March 21, 2016 1:33 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: Fwd: Lexington Ave Install

FYI

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Backert, John M" <John.Backert@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: March 21, 2016 at 1:07:12 PM EDT

To: Michael <mhayman@iglou.com>

Subject: FW: Lexington Ave Install

Mike,
Here is the pricing for the parrotia install from Adam Vogelsang.
Please review and forward to Kyle Etheridge.

John Backert

Brightside - Landscape Coordinator
Louisville Forward — Develop Louisville
527 West Jefferson Street, 6 floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Phone 502 574-3937
John.backert@louisvilleky.gov

STAY CONNECTED TO BRIGHTSIDE

B E

From: Adam Vogelsang [mailto:brownsborolawncare@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, March 21, 2016 12:02 AM

To: Backert, John M

Subject: Lexington Ave Install

Hello Mr.Backert,

Below you will find the pricing for the project we discussed. Should you have any questions
please let me know as [ am always happy answer them all. Have a great day.

Included in estimated price:



- Remove two existing trees

- Remove two existing stumps
- Round Up entire bed area

- Pick up 5 supplied trees

- Imnstall 5 ;@lﬂi&dﬁeﬁ‘\}
- Water truck first 4 weeks after ins

ated Price: $960.00

Estij

Optional Upgr

- Mulch entire bed area: $900
- Water truck services: $95

Cheers,

Adam Vogelsang

Brownsboro Lawn Care

1901 Brownsboro Rd.
Louisville, Ky 40206
502-724-3619
www.brownsborolawncare.com




