Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

d Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

1 Paving Fund (PAYV)

l Primary Sponsor: CM Tom Owen

l Amount: $2,900.00 Date: 04-13-2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funds to be used to continue sidewalk in front of 1435 Rosewood Ave. To carry a
new 6' sidewalk thru the rest of the property. Sidewalk now stops mid way thru
property. This cost would also include grass seeding.

City Agency:  Louisville Public Works
Contact Person:  Steve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: 502-574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a pubhc purpose.
B el #290- % 4-13-J0ll

District # Counc11 Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: ' Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name:
Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Mémber(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

No

NA

No

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

Date:

04-13-2016

Effectlve ]uly 2015




Long, Terra L

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 2:35 PM

To: Long, Terra L

Cc: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: New sidewalk estimate in front of 1435 Rosewood Ave

Public Works can accept CIF funds, however we cannot do this new sidewalk project without an account # with sufficient
funds provided.
Once funds are in place, it should take long to complete this particular project.

Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky

From: Long, Terra L

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 2:13 PM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M.; Owen, Tom

Cc: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: New sidewalk estimate in front of 1435 Rosewood Ave

Will you accept CIF from District 8 for this project.

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Friday, April 01, 2016 2:54 PM

To: Long, Terra L; Owen, Tom

Subject: New sidewalk estimate in front of 1435 Rosewood Ave

CM Owen / Terra,

The estimate for Service Request # 4580687 & # 4573119 sidewalk project (in front of 1435 Rosewood Ave.). The
current sidewalk stops midway thpu’tﬁé\front of their property. To carry new 6’ sidewalk thru the rest of the property
the total cost would be approx¢S2, 900. The costs all include 40’ of new 6 wide concrete sidewalk and grass seeding &
protection and contingencies for-anything unforeseen.

If you have any questions regarding anything related to this work, please don’t hesitate to contact me.
Thanks,

Steve Kurowsky, PE

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Streets & Roads

Metro Development Center

444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, Ky. 40202

Tel (0): (502) 574-8743

Tel (¢): (502) 565-7601

Steve.Kurowskyv@louisvilleky.gov




