Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

[0 Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

O Paving Fund (PAY)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Amount;: $40,000 Date: April 22, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Capital Infrastructure Funds will be directed to Louisville Forward to fund a study
to expand the Dixie Highway Master Plan along Dixie Highway from the Gene
Snyder Freeway to the Jefferson County Line.

City Agency:  Louisville Forward
Contact Person:  Jeff O'Brien

Agency Phone: 502-574-1354

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

14 i $40,000 4/22{2018
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount; ' _ Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost; ) Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



Department/Project; Louisville Forward/South Dixie Highway Study

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose,

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # . Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: | ouisville Forward

1

Program/Project Name: South Dixie Highway Study }
Yes/No/NA
- Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If“n_'!atching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
: Requesf Form: If other funds are to be used for this project,ma_r_e they =
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding So_urce_IfCIFlsbem_grEquested, does Metro Louisvilléwﬁwn/will
_own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
. probably NDF.
““““ Fundmg Source: If CIFis bemg reqa;sted, does t'héwproject have a usefui
 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Ag;ar;cy greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
Ordinance Réquired: Isthe request atransfer from NDF to cost center? If
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Sdpporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? NA
Prepared by; Date: Apnl 22,2016

Effective July 2015



Bowman, Michael
L.

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Friday, April 22, 2016 12:41 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: Dixie Study CIF

Michael,

Please sign the South Dixie Highway Study CIF cn my behalf.
Thanks

Cindi

Thank you,

Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council | District 14
p:(502) 574-1114

e: cindi.fowler@louisvilleky.gov



Bowman, Michael
.~ ]

From: OBrien, Jeff

Sent: Monday, April 25, 2016 10:35 AM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: RE: South Dixie Study Funding

Hi Michael -

We will accept the funds to move forward with the South Dixie Highway study.
Please let me know if you would like any further information.

Thank you,

Jeff

Jeff O’Brien, AICP

Deputy Director, Office of Advanced Planning
Develop Louisville

LOUISVILLE FORWARD

502.574.1354

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Monday, April 25, 2016 10:34 AM
To: OBrien, Jeff

Subject: Scuth Dixie Study Funding

lJeff,

Councilwoman Fowler and other members have agreed to fund the South Dixie Highway study at $40,000 for the initial
RFP.

Will Louisville Forward accept this funding for this purpose?

A response to this email will suffice. Please let me know if you have any additional questions.
Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall
e: michael.bowman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West lefferson Street, Ste. 307
w: www.louisvilleky.gov/district14 Louisville, Kentucky 40202




