Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

] Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[] Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler

Amount: $583.00 Date: Aprit 27, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Permanent trash receptacle for St. Joseph Neighborhood Association.

City Agency:  Solid Waste
Contact Person: Steve Fenster

Agency Phone: 502-8116

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

15 $583.00 4/27/16
District # Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: | Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Solid Waste

Program/Project Name: Trash receptacle

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Isthe Requést Signe'd by all Council Mémber(s) .
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is beihg feqﬁestéd, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is No
probably NDF.
Fundihg Source: If CIFis being requéstéd, does the pfbj'é'cfha\'/'e' auseful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ Yes
Ordinance Required: s the NDF requést to a Metro Agen'cy gréatér than
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. ~ NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? Yes
Prepared by: Date: April 27, 2016

S —
Effective July 2015



Hughes, Susan

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2016 10:12 AM
To: Hughes, Susan

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Trash Receptacle damaged
Categories: Butler

The cost is the same as a new one. Seems too damaged and twisted for it to ever look the same again.
$583.

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 3:03 PM
To: Fenster, Steve A

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Trash Receptacle damaged

Thank you Steve, we will wait for the estimate on repair.

Susan W. Hughes
Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
District 15

502-574-1115

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 3:00 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Trash Receptacle damaged

We can have it removed if you want. | will get an estimate on repair versus replacement and let you know the costs.
Engineering would have to see where it could be placed and give their approval for placement.

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Tuesday, April 12, 2016 2:54 PM
To: Fenster, Steve A

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: Trash Receptacle damaged

The Northwest corner of Preston at Eastern Parkway, the trash receptacle has been damaged by a large vehicle cutting
the corner to short. Councilwoman Butler is wanting to have the receptacle repaired if possible, and if not,
replaced. She also wants it moved back further from the corner to prevent this from occurring again.

So, if you can tell us what is the best way to handle this request, we will be glad to start the process. Thanks so much
Steve.



