Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

OO0

Primary Sponsor: Cindi Fowler

| Amount: $75,000 Date: 5/15/16

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Additional funding needed to pave Girvan, Pierce Way and Fruitwood (in that priority
order) on the original FY16 MAP/MAP Match list.

$16,073.92 8676 410 8106 048214 822702

$16,073.92 8126 410 8105 148946 822814

$25,000.00 8101 410 8210 148941 822702

$75,000.00 8126 410 8105 148947 822814

Using these funds PW&A has up to $132,147.84 for these paving projects. No
estimates have been prepared so no attachments is included.

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets
Contact Person:  Matt Haines

Agency Phone: 502 574 3883

I have reviewed this an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

GCTLTY 47w Sl
District # Council meerww CC M le@V Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Puyblic Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Paving Girvan, Pierce Way and Fruitwood in District 14
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? . If not, the funding source is NA
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

and description of cost? NA

Prepared by: Date:  5/15/16
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Hoffman, Elizabeth K
M

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 1:11 PM

To: Hoffman, Elizabeth K

Subject: FW: District 14 CDBG and misc paving
Thank you,

Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:(502) 574-1114
e: cindi.fowler@louisvilleky.gov

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Wednesday, April 20, 2016 7:00 AM
To: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: District 14 CDBG and misc paving

Here’s the routes, pavement condition and cost estimates for your CDBG roads. Let me know if there's anything else
you’'ll need.

D 14 CDBG Request

Length
Street Name From To {mi) PCl Est Cost
Tennis Blvd Watson Ln End south of Watson 0.286 38 $28,314
Sandray Blvd Watson Ln End 0.288 42 528,512
Beeston Blvd Watson Ln Rainbow Dr 0.346 39 $34,254

Here are the roadways we’ll be paving this fiscal year in your district with the local road surplus funds:

Length
Street Name From To {mi) PCI Est Cost
Pendleton Rd Dixie Forge Cir 43 0.31 $30,690
Horncastle Way John Adams Hinchbrook 27 0.37 $36,630
John Adams Way Snowden Horncastle 46 0.07 $6,930
Snowden Way Horncastle End 17 0.23 $22,770
Hinchbrook Blvd John Adams End 28 0.29 $28,710

Here are some potential routes that can be done with the additional $75,000 is still have available for paving:
D 14 $75k paving funding

I Betsy Ross Dr Jjeeston Bivd Nathan Hale Way (end) ] 0.59 33 , 558,410 |
Wimstock Ave | Ethan Allen Way | Hopedale Way 0.4853 34 548,045
Tennis Blvd Watson Ln Ethan Allen Way 0.23 28 $22,770




These cost estimates are based on our standard per mile paving cost and will be updated after the inspector has had an
opportunity to check the area. After this inspection report is complete, I'll update the costs and provide you additional
information on potential roads that can be paved in your District

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 s 5" St, 4™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-0065

Cell (502)773-3222
Jeffrey.brown@louisvilleky.gov




Ott, Stephen

— o = = m———
From: Fowler, Cindi
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 4:13 PM
To: Ott, Stephen
Ce: Hoffman, Elizabeth K
Subject: signature

Stephen,

Please allow Elizabeth Hoffman to sign the paving appropriation for me in my absence. Michael is off work this week
and this needs to be heard in appropriations tomorrow. Thanks for your assistance. If you have any questions please
call me at 593-3371. Thanks Stephen! Cindi

Thank you,

Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council | District 14
p:(502) 574-1114

e: cindi.fowler@louisvilleky.gov

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202



