Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

D Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
O Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[] Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

I Primary Sponsor: Madonna Flood

| Amount: $75,000 Date: 5/15/16

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Small Boat Ct $6,930 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Squire Neagli Ct $8,910 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Longboat Ct Sirate Ln $6,930 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Spy Glass Ct Normie Ln $7,920 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Normie Ct Normie Ln $8,910 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Caven Ct Caven Ave $8,910 8126 410 8105 148947 822824
Gunn Ct Caven Ave $6,930 8126 410 8105 148947 822824

Jim Hawkins Dr Caven Ave Normie Ln  $21,780 8126 410 8105 148947 822824

Using these PAV funds PW&A has up to $75,000 for the paving projects listed above.

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets
Contact Person:  Matt Haines

Agency Phone: 502 574 3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose.
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Derouen, Andrea

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 11:52 AM
To: Derouen, Andrea; Flood, Madonna
Cc: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: $75,000

We'll accept the funds and get these roads scheduled

e

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smartphone

———————— Original message --------

From: "Derouen, Andrea" <Andrea.Derouen@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 05/16/2016 11:30 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Flood, Madonna" <Madonna.Flood@louisvilleky.gov>, "Brown, Jeffrey-E"
<Jeffrey. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: $75,000

Street Name From To PCl Length Cost Est
Small Boat Ct End End 23 0.07 $6,930
Squire Neagli Ct Sirate Ln Neagli Ct 54 0.09 $8,910
Longboat Ct Sirate Ln End 34 0.07 $6,930
Spy Glass Ct Normie Ln End 25 0.08 $7,920
Normie Ct Normie Ln End 37 0.09 $8,910
Caven Ct Caven Ave End 33 0.09 $8,910
Gunn Ct Caven Ave "End 27 0.07 $6,930
Jim Hawkins Dr Caven Ave Normie Ln 40 0.22 $21,780

Jeff--

These are the streets we would like to use our $75,000 designated for paving to pave. Please send me an email back
saying you will accept our funds so | may start our paperwork..

Thank you.

From: Flood, Madonna

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 9:23 AM
To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: Derouen, Andrea

Subject: FW: $75,000

Please see email below where $75,000 for paving will be going per request of Public Works



