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Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council l\}lefnber(s)
~ Appropriating Funding?

| RéqueSt Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Réquest Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

, Funding Source: If CIF is being}edﬁested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Fijhding Source: If CIF is being requested,\‘does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supportii’ig Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?
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Smith, Wanda M }

" - - L
From: Eisinger, John (Rolf)
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 12:07 PM
To: James, David A
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Smith, Wanda M
Subject: RE: 4th St Viaduct by Industry

Hello Councilman James,
Have you had a chance to check on funding for this project?
Thanks,

Rolf

From: James, David A

Sent: Friday, May 06, 2016 10:55 PM
To: Eisinger, John (Rolf)

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Smith, Wanda M
Subject: Re: 4th St Viaduct by Industry
John,

That sounds good, I'll check on funding Monday and will let you know .

Thanks,
David

Sent from my iPhone

Have A Great Day !!

David James

On May 6, 2016, at 16:18, Eisinger, John (Rolf) <JohnRolf.Eisinger@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
Hello Councilman James,
My contractor let me know that they just replaced the post on 4™ Street. Also our consultant said it

would cost| or them to look into the 4™ St Viaduct project. Do you have any extra funds to get
them started, or would you like me to look into using some of our Urban Bike Network funding?

Below are the post meeting notes from the site visit:

Meeting Notes

At the request of Councilman James, we met at the 4™ Street Viaduct to investigate drainage and
lighting, associated with safety concerns in the sidewalk and bike {anes.
1



Hello Councilman James,

Last Friday | met with one of our engineering consultants on site about this project. They
are planning on providing a cost that would cover an initial assessment. | will let you
know how much this will be to get them started. Depending on the cost, | might be able
to cover it with our Urban Bike Network fund. Just wanted to give you an update.

Also, I provided our post contractor notice to proceed with replacing the posts under
the via duct. | am hoping they will have these missing posts replaced within two weeks.

Thanks,

Rolf

From: Eisinger, John (Rolf)

Sent: Friday, April 15, 2016 8:11 AM
To: James, David A

Subject: 4th St Viaduct by Industry

Hello Councilman,

This project has been a tough one that | haven’t received much feedback on yet. | will
keep pushing it along and hope to have a meeting with one of our consults to look into
next week. | hope to have a couple of solutions and cost estimates in a few weeks.

I will keep you in the loop about my progress.

Rolf
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John "Rolf" Eisinger, MPH, PMP, LCI

Bicycle and Pedestrian Coordinator
Louisville Metro Department of Public Works and Assets
444 S 5th St., Suite 400

Louisville, KY 40202-4311

John.Eisinger@louisvilleky.gov
502.574.6473



