Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[] capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[] Paving Fund (PAV)

rPrimary Sponsor: Councilwoman Jessica Green District 1

[ Amount: $10,000.00 Date: 05/31/2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

To add a new sidewalk across the road at Dover rd and Rockford Lane . Currently pedestrians
are walking a dirt path that is dangerously close to Rockford Lane . The new sidewalk will be
ADA approved to allow wheel chair accessibility with the necessary curb cuts and connect up
with the sidewalk that was ended on Rockford Lane @ 2709 Rockford Lane

2701 -05 Rockford Lane ( SR# 4547809 ) $ 20,000.00

Total $20,000.00/ MAP Match Total $ 10,000.00
Half funded from Map Match 8126 410 8105 148946 822801 "

City Agency:  Metro Public Works & Assets
Contact Person:  Craig L Allen

Agency Phone: 502 574 6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for ajpublic purpose.
D1 | ol 4 / $10,000.00 05/31/2016
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

!

\

\Y,
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: \Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: District 1 Sidewalks & Curb cuts
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) - B

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amount? No

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will

own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is NA

probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than k ,

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Prepared by: Charles Weathers Date: 05/31/2016

Effective July 2015



Weathers, Charles

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2016 10:57 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Cc Barr, Gerald F

Subject: Curb Cut and New Sidewalk Estimate
Attachments: IMG_1485jpg; IMG_1490.jpg; IMG_1491 jpg

Good morning Charles,

Today | inspected the curb cut request you received from a constituent for a curb cut at the corner of Dover and
Rockford; the SR # is 4547809. | attached some pictures for you to see. | recommend that if Councilwoman Green wants
to fund the sidewalk ramp she also install a new sidewalk across the road. Currently, pedestrians are walking a dirt path
that’s dangerously close to the road; this is a dirt path someone in a wheel chair could not use.

The new sidewalk would connect up to an existing sidewalk that crosses a culvert behind a guardrail. The sidewalk that
crosses the culvert would need to be replaced. This sidewalk has two major trip hazards (one rated a 5 and the other
rated a 4). There is also a steep bank that would need to be regraded (picture attached) and a ditch where a pipe and
dirt would have to be added to cross (picture also attached.)

Total the repair and new sidewalk would cost $20,000. If Councilwoman Green is able to fund this project | will be the
project manager.

Thank you,

Craty Aten

Engineer 1

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5" Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office. (502) 574-6159

Fax: (502) 574-4129
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Weathers, Charles

From: NO-REPLY_MIDAS@louisvillemsd.org

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2016 10:57 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Subject: Service Request #4547809 has been resolved

Your Service Request has been resolved.

Service Request #: 4547809

Service Request Type: APZ CURB RAMP - APZ CURB RAMP, CURB CUT
Resolved Date: 5/26/2016 10:56:51 AM

Resolved Code: NOTED



