Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

El Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[1 Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Dan Johnson

| Amount: $3,250.00 Date: June 6, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

installation of pavement markings along Bluegrass Ave from Peachtree Ave to
Southern Parkway.

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets

Contact Person:  Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650
I have reviewed this request for ap- ture of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a p pur
21 é /‘/'/ $3,250 6-6-16
District # Councﬂ Me@ﬁ Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




Interagency Name: Public Works and Assets

Program/Project Name: installation of pavement markings on Bluegrass Ave

Yes/No/NA

~ Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
- request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
: Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
'Funding Source: If CIF i‘ékbeing rebquested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
- probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIFis being reduested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
| VO‘rdirianée‘Reduirédv:' Is the NDF request to a Metro Agé‘n‘cy great‘er than
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. No
Ordinance RéqUired: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
: Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Effeive July 2




Mathews, Bryan L

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Monday, June 06, 2016 3:02 PM
To: Mathews, Bryan L

Subject: RE: Bluegrass Ave.

Bryan,

The cost estimate to install pavement markings along Bluegrass Ave from Peachtree Ave to Southern Pkwy is

$3,250. Please understand this project is being funded through Council’s office and LMPW will not be able to accept
responsibility to refresh these markings once they become deficient. If the markings are to be refreshed it will have to
be funded by an outside source in the same way it is initially.

Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650

From: Mathews, Bryan L

Sent: Friday, June 03, 2016 12:37 PM
To: Sparks, Stuart

Subject: FW: Bluegrass Ave.

Hey Stuart — Is there a possibility | can get the estimates in time for the Monday, June 6, new business deadline? That
way | can go ahead and get the ball rolling on the funding.

Also, have you heard any updates on if the Male sign has been posted?

Thanks! Bryan

From: Mathews, Bryan L

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 5:22 PM
To: Sparks, Stuart

Subject: Bluegrass Ave,

Stuart - Councilman Johnson is requesting an estimate for striping on bluegrass ave from Southern Parkway to
peachtree.

He also wants an estimate for striping on peachtree from Brookline to west ashland.

He has authorized me to begin the appropriations process once the estimate is received.




