
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

D Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[7] Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)
D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
D Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: President David Yates

Amount: $1,550.00 Date: 7/25/2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Purchase of a new All Terrain Vehicle (ATV) Trailer to transport 3rd Division
LMPD ATVs to police areas in Southwest Louisville such as: Riverview Park,
Jefferson Memorial Park and the Sand Pit.

City Agency: LMPD

Contact Person: Sharon Abney

Agency Phone: (502) 657^

will be used/for a pu^ic pur

District # \^. tScnJn^il Member Signature

I have revie^dlhis requesf\for an e of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

$500
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



Department/Project: i-MPD /ATV Tra"er

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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Revised July 2015



GIF, NDF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LMPD

Program/Project Name: ATV Trailer

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the |
request exclude the matching fund amount? |

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

No

No

Yes

Prepared by: Brian Boles Date: 7/25/2016

Effective July 2015



87/13/2616 10:36 5023484442 JOE HILLS INC PAGE 01/01

QUOTATION PAOE; 1

JOE HILL'S AUTO CENTER
103 South Saiem Dr
P.O, Box 46
Bardstown, Ky 40004
Phone #; (502)348-2532
Fax #: (502)348-4442

PHONE 9; (S02)773"80ZS
CELL*:
ALT,«:

P.O.f; sharon abney

TERMS; Net 30 EOM

SALES TYPE: Quote

DAl'K- 6/27/2016

ORDER #: 1205934
CUSTOMER*: 270SS

Cl>; MattS

LOCATION; 1
STATUS; Active

fifiA ¥0 27098
DIVISION OF FLEET MANAGEMENT

3S15NEVv/BURGRD
LOUISVILLE, KY 40204

SH TO
DIVISION OF FLEET MANAGEMENT

3515NEWBURGRD
LOUISVILLE, KY 40204

MWi IrK(M»1i%f'mJMBER:
TRA ST7214TA-B.030

.DiescKiiwoN ".-.
SURE-TRAC 6X14 TUBE TOP ANGLE

THIS QUOTE 1$ GOOD FOR 90 DAYS

Q.TY
1

VSICE
?1,745.00

NfiT- ", :1:-.
$1,550.00

.,TO«E-"",;.-:
$1,550.00

SllRTOTAt:
TAX;

OR&RR TOTAL:

$1,550.00
$0.08

$1,550.00

Authorized By:



Boles, Brian

From:
Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:
Attachments:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Abney, Sharon G
Tuesday, July 12, 2016 11:07 AM
Bales, Brian

Yates, David; Boyd, Bruce; Abney, Sharon G
ATV Trailer for the Third Division

SKMBT_65416071209320.pdf

Follow up
Completed

Attached is the requested quotation for an ATV trailer for the Third Division. Thank you so much for looking into the
possibility of funding the purchase of the trailer for our division and if you need further information, please contact
me. We really appreciate your help.

Sharon Abney
LMPD Third Division

(502)657-6806



Bales. Brian

From:

Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Abney,Sharon G
Tuesday, June 28, 2016 4:19 PM
Bales, Brian

Boyd, Bruce; Abney, Sharon G
RE: ATV Trailer

One of our Officers, Todd Boyd called Councilman Yates last week and asked about funding for an ATV trailer
for the Third Division. Councilman Yates asked for the information because he said you all were working on
the budget for the new fiscal year. I am waiting for additional information regarding the cost of a trailer which
would haul two ATVs. I have received a quote of $1,550 from Joe Hill's Auto Center and we are double-
checking to make sure this company will be an authorized vendor for Metro Government for the new fiscal
year. Anything you all can do for the Third Division will be appreciated. Please contact me if you need
additional information. Thanks

From: Bales, Brian
Sent: Tuesday, June 28, 2016 4:04 PM
To: Abney, Sharon G; Yates, David
Cc: Boyd, Bruce
Subject: RE: ATV Trailer

Sharon,

Please fill me in. I am not familiar with this phone call/issue.

Todd,

Any help?

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles@louisvilleky^gp_y

Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under



applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you arc notified that any review, use, disclosure,
distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this commiinicatioii in error, please

contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Abney, Sharon G
Sent: Tuesday, June 28, 2016 4:01 PM
To: Yates, David
Cc: Boyd, Bruce; Abney, Sharon G
Subject: ATV Trailer

I am still waiting on additional information for the ATV trailer Officer Boyd called you about last week. I will
send you our request for funding as soon as possible.

SHARON ABNEY
LOUISVILLE METRO POLICE
THIRD DIVISION
SOUTHWEST GOVERNMENT CENTER
7219 DIXIE HWY.
LOUISVILLE, KY 40258
(502) 657-6806



Bales, Brian

From:

Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Welch, Vicki A
Wednesday, July 20, 2016 11:11 PM
Bales, Brian

Blackwell, Rick; Fowler, Cindi; Yates, David; Kennedy, Liz; Bowman, Michael; Triplett,
Kevin D

Re: 3rd Division ATV Trailer GIF Request

Yes I will do $350. Kevin can sign for me since I won't be in the office the rest of the week.

Vicki Aubrey Welch
Louisville Metro Council
District 13 Councilwoman
502-574-1113
Sent from my iPhone

On Jul20,2016, at 10:55 PM, Bales, Brian <Brian.Boles(%louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilman Blackwell, Councilwoman Fowler and Councilwoman Welch:

President Yates has been contacted by Major Hardison and officers of the 3rd Division about the need of
a new ATV trailer to transport ATVs throughout our community to police areas such as Riverview Park,
Jefferson Memorial Park and the old Sand Pit. President Yates has agreed to fund the purchase of a new
ATV trailer to ensure our officers are able to continue to police our community for our constituents.
President Yates has committed $500.00 toward the total $1,550.00 estimate. President Yates asks that
you help fund this purchase for our officers with a $350 CIF appropriation. Please let our office know if
you are willing to help fund this request and I will deliver the paperwork to your office as soon as
possible. Thank you for your consideration. If you have any questions please call me at 574-1125.

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles@touisvijieky.goy

Office: (502) 574-1125

<SKMBT C364el6071315570.pd£>



Boles, Brian

From:

Sent:

To:
Cc:

Subject:

Bales, Brian

Monday, July 25, 2016 10:01 AM
Fowler, Cindi

Blackwell, Rick; Welch, Vicki A; Yates, David; Kennedy, Liz; Bowman, Michael; Triplett,
Kevin D

RE: 3rd Division ATV Trailer GIF Request

Great. Thank you to all. I will get the paperwork together and ask for your signature as soon as possible.

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles@louisvillekv.ROv

Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,

distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Fowler, Cindi
Sent: Saturday, July 23, 2016 10:15 PM
To: Bales, Brian
Cc: Blackwell, Rick; Welch, Vicki A; Yates, David; Kennedy, Liz; Bowman, Michael; Triplett, Kevin D
Subject: Re: 3rd Division ATV Trailer GIF Request

I am in

Thank you,
Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council I District 14

p:(502) 574-1114
e: cindi.fowlerfa),louisvillekv.gov

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

On Jul21,2016, at 1:35 PM, "Bales, Brian" <Brian.Boles(%louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
1



Thank you Councilman.

Thank you,

<image001.git>

Brian Boles
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Email: brian.boles@louisvitlekv.gov

Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, incliiding any attachments, is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally

privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure, distributing or copying of this coinmunication is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please contact the sender by reply e-

mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Blackwell, Rick
Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 7:20 AM
To: Bales, Brian
Cc: Fowler, Cindi; Welch, Vicki A; Yates, David; Kennedy, Liz; Bowman, Michael; Triplett, Kevin D
Subject: Re: 3rd Division MV Trailer GIF Request

I am in

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul20,2016,at 10:55 PM, Bales, Brian <Brian.Boles(%louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilman Blackwell, Councilwoman Fowler and Councilwoman Welch:

President Yates has been contacted by Major Hardison and officers of the 3rd Division
about the need of a new ATV trailer to transport ATVs throughout our community to
police areas such as Riverview Park, Jefferson Memorial Park and the old Sand Pit.
President Yates has agreed to fund the purchase of a new ATV trailer to ensure our
officers are able to continue to police our community for our constituents. President
Yates has committed $500.00 toward the total $1,550.00 estimate. President Yates asks
that you help fund this purchase for our officers with a $350 GIF appropriation. Please let
our office know if you are willing to help fund this request and I will deliver the
paperwork to your office as soon as possible. Thank you for your consideration. If you
have any questions please call me at 574-1125.

Thank you,

<image001.gi£>

Brian Bales
Legislative Assistant
President David Yates


