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Hamilton, Cheri

==

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Friday, August 5, 2016 7:17 AM

To: Hamilton, Cheri; Bradley, Maxwell B.

Cc " Friend-Ellis, Myra; Hackett, Keith; Sullivan, Kimberly L
Subject: RE: decorative cans .

Councilwoman Hamilton,

Thank you for your request for decorative cans. [ am happy to report the contract was just awarded on August 2, 2016.
Below you will find the new price list. Orders are placed once the funds have been transferred to SWMS. The installs
depend on the availability of the laser lettering. Usually 30 to 45 days.

If you have any further questions please feel free to contact me.

Trash can square $598.00 Liners $140.00. (§120.00 if 20 or more)
Trash cans round $1010.00 :
Newspaper Corrals $1240.00

COSTS FOR RERPAIR OF CORRALS/ RECEPTACLES

Labor $89.00 per hour

Material markup 50%

Cost for removal of Damaged units $45.00 per for receptacles and $65.00 per corral

Thank you again,

Steven A. Fenster .

Solid Waste Administrator

Louisville Metro Public Works

Division of Solid Waste Management Services
600 Meriwether Avenue

Louisville, KY 40217

Office: (502)574-8116

Fax: (502) 574-4155

Email: steve.fenster@louisvilleky.gov

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Thursday, August 04, 2016 6:05 PM
To: Fenster, Steve A; Bradley, Maxwell B.
Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: decorative cans



| would like to get at least 10 more decorative cans for the Historic Portland neighborhood. Please let me know the
costs and how soon they can be fabricated and installed.
Thanks!

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Monday, June 27, 2016 S:20 AM
To: Hamilton, Cheri; Bradley, Maxwell B.
Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: decorative cans

Max, - "

What's the latest on the renewal/bid process for the decorative waste containers?
Thank you,

Steven

From: Hamilton, Cheri )
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2016,2:07 PM
To: Fenster, Steve A

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: decorative cans

| would like 7 more decorative cans for the Historic Portland neighborhood as soon as your contract is completed.
Thanks!
Councilwoman Hamilton



Historic Decorative Portland Garbage

Can Locations

1. Shaheen’s — 26" & Portland Ave.
2. 26™ & Portland in front of Janes Brothers Hardware
3. Corner of 26" & Bank (@ Bus Stop — SW Corner

4. Entrance of Family Health Center
5. 22" & Cleveland or 22™ & Griffins NW Corner
6. 1800 Portland Ave. in front of the Table Restaurant

7. 1512 Portland Ave. in front of Tim Faulkner Art Gallery
8. 359 N. 26" St SE Corner in front of Lucky Jr’s
9. 25" & Montgomery NW Corner

10. 29" & Portland SW Corner



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Sely 4 washe W\Wdésﬂ/)wnd’ Storecon
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Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? - Lém

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? o A/ﬁ,
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amaount? --- /?//9
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they ; /},
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - /);

Fundihg Source: "If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will

own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is o /]/ ;9_,
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful /,/ ﬁ/

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. s %@O

Ordinance Required: [s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If A/ @
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate igf/)

and description of cost?




