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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Kramer |

| Amount: $11,080.36 Date: Sep 7, 2016 [

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
To repair broken sidewalks in District 11 under the following Service Request Numbers: 4658881,
4659280, 4659279, 4659278, 4659275, 4659272, 4659269, 4659267 and 4659263.

City Agency: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets, 444 S. 5th St., Suite 400

Contact Person: Craig Alien, Engineer 1

Agency Phone: (502) 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

11 A/Q /W $11,080.36 Sep 7, 2016
District # Counci#Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Broken Sidewalk Repairs/District 11 Phase 4
" Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

‘Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes

B
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Harrington, Scott

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, September 06, 2016 1:16 PM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: FW: Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Scott — Here is one more estimate on Cloudcroft Ln.

This will make the total $11,080.36.

Thanks,
SR 4658881
LOCATION 8005 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 4
DATE SENT 9/6/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS | - 5x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $376.83
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. - Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.
Craig Allen
Engineer
Louisville Metro Public Works
574-6159

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, September 06, 2016 11:04 AM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Scott, you are correct, the total is $10,703.53.

If Councilman Kramer is able to fund these repairs please let me know and I'll include these with the repairs that will be
done in the fall.

Thanks,

Craig Allen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works
574-6159

From: Harrington, Scott
Sent: Tuesday, September 06, 2016 10:46 AM



To: Alien, Craig L
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Craig — thank you for the estimates. Check my total but my amount to repair all is $10,703.53.
Let me run this by my councilman and get approval. I'll let you know his decision if we fund some or all.

Scott

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Aide
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West jefferson Street
email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

Sign up for District 11’s E-Newsletter

Thani you for the

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, September 02, 2016 4:59 PM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: Sidewalk Repair Estimates

Scott,

Here are the estimates you requested recently. | will be the project manager for these repairs. If Councilman Kramer
plans to repair all of these at some point | recommend repairing all of them at once, if it's possible. Thanks!

SR# 4659280
LOCATION 8125 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 3
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 10x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $753.65
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.



4659279

SR#
LOCATION 8123 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11

RATE 4

DATE SENT 9/2/2016

ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 12x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $851.40

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.
SR# 4659278
LOCATION 8117 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 3
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
22x4 of sw, one gas valve, seed and

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,062.80

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 4659275
LOCATION 8113 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 4
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 8x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $681.12

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 4659272
LOCATION 8121 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 3
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 12x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $851.40




Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 4659269
LOCATION 8108 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 4
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
10x4 of sw, one gas valve, seed and
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,113.65
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

SR# 4659267
LOCATION 8022 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 3
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
24x4 of sw, prune tree roots, seed and
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,418.68
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

SR# 4659263
LOCATION 8011 Cloudcroft Ln
REQUESTED BY Dist 11
RATE 4
DATE SENT 9/2/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 26x4 of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,970.83
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

Craiy sHlen

Engineer I

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400




Louisville, KY 40202
Office: (502) 574-6159
Fax: (502) 574-4129



