
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

. Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: President David Yates

Amount: $564.00 Date: Sep 21, 2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location ofproject/program and any external grantee(s):

3 honorary Street Signs "Arch Gleason Way" on Chapel Street at W. Main Street and W. Market
Streets the final sign to be presented to the family of Mr. Gleason.

City Agency: Metro Public Works & Assets

Contact Person: Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 502-574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

25 ^t7®?- 564.00

District # Council Membet^ignature Amount

Sep 21, 2016

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Date

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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Bales, Brian

From:

Sent:

To:
Subject:

Yates, David

Thursday, September 22, 2016 9:52 AM
Bales, Brian

KY Lottery Resolution/Appropriation

Brian,

Please sign for me on the appropriation of the honorary street signs for Mr. Arch Gleason. I understand the total to be
$564.00. Thank you.

Thank you,

^
David Yates
Louisville Metro Council President

District 25 Councilman

601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: david.vates@louisvillekv.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,

distribiiting or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Arch Gleason Way Honorary Street Signs

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

Submitted by: Brian Bates Date: Sep21,20t§

Revised May 2 016



Yates, David

From:
Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Roades, BonnieJ

Tuesday, September 20, 2016 1:39 PM
Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Boles, Brian
Yates, David; Sparks, Stuart; Jennings, Patricia A; Hall, Barbara C
RE: Honorary Street Sign

Wo for the one sign per ssparks is 2619191

From: Slaughter, Kenneth G.
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 11:36 AM
To: Bales, Brian

Cc: Yates, David; Sparks, Stuart; Jennings, Patricia A; Hall, Barbara C; Roades, Bonnie J
Subject: RE: Honorary Street Sign

Good Morning Brian!

Wecancertamlyhave the initial sign ready by October 21st. The cost per sign will run
$188;®0. To initiate fabrication we will only need to know the amount of signs needed along
with the cost center account number. Additionally, we will need you to confirm the desired1
message for the honorary signs.

Once the resolution has passed we will have the remaining honorary signs ready for installation
within three weeks. If we can provide any further assistance please feel free to contact us.

Kindly,

Kenny Slaughter
£ouisviffe Metro ffovernment
P^& assets - {SIQWS & MJA'RXI^N'QS 'DJVlSIOM'}
1450 Lexington Rd., Louisville, KY 40206
{Office} 502-574-2710
{Cell} 502-794-6862
{E-mail} kenneth.slauehter(%louisvillekv.eov

From: Sparks, Stuart
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 11:06 AM
To: Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Jennings, Patricia A; Hall, Barbara C; Roades, Bonnie J
Cc: Boles, Brian; Yates, David
Subject: FW: Honorary Street Sign

Brian,

That shouldn't be a problem. We need to know exactly what you would like the sign to say.

1



Kenny,

Please provide CM Yates' office with a cost of the requested signs and schedule the fabrication of one of the
signs. We are going to fabricate the first one before resolution for them to present to the Mr. Gleason. Once we have
the documentation for official designation we will schedule the fabrication and installation of the others.

Bonnie,

Please set up a WO to fabricate one sign. Another WO will come soon.

Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE
Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

From: Bales, Brian
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 10:53 AM
To; Sparks, Stuart
Cc; Yates, David
Subject: Honorary Street Sign

Stuart,

President Yates would like to fabricate an honorary street sign (Arch Gleason Way) for Mr. Arch Gleason, Long-time (23
years) President & CEO of the Kentucky Lottery. Currently Mr. Chip Polston is working to rename a street near the
headquarters of the Kentucky Lottery, whose address is: 1011 W. Main Street, Louisville, KY 40202.1 believe it is North
llth Street between Main Street and Rowan Street or it could be the access way off of 11th Street to the Parking Lot.

KY Lottery is having an event on October 21st, 2016 to support the Gleason family and say thank you for all of Mr.
Gteason's hard work and dedication to KY Lottery. As the process for the official and formal naming will take much
longer and will not be official by October 21st, President Yates is interested in fabricating an Honorary street sign to have
ready by October 21st to present to the family as a gesture for Arch's leadership.

Please let me know the cost and time that this would take to be completed. We would like to fund as soon as possible if
this is possible.

Thank you,

Brian Boles
Legislative Assists nt
President David Yates

District 25
601 West Jefferson St, 1st floor



Louisville,KY40202

Email: brian.boles@louisvillekv.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,

distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.


