Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: CM Tom Owen |

| Amount: $5000.00 Date: Sept. 20, 2016 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
ALLEY MAP funding will be used to fix or repair the brick alley that runs between Cherokee Road
and Everett Ave. from Highland Ave and Grindstead Drive. This is in a historic district and must be
repaired with in kind material which will be brick or pavers.

$5000.00 out of 8th Dist. CIF vy dip ” %S = 1)
$5000.00 to be used out of account number dlot Yio 8a10 48937 g
$10,000.00 out of Metro Public Works budget. TOTAL $20,000.00

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Matthew Haines

Agency Phone: 502-574-4129

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

8 Cyg:iw @Lxm\ $5000.00 9-20-2016

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Metro Public Works funding and 8th Dist. MAP/CIF matching funds

Program/Project Name: Repair of alley between Cherokee Rd and Everett, running from Highland A
: : IR Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF,

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF reqluésufa a Metro Agenéy greatéi‘rtharfl il

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

NA

NA

Yes

~J e
Submitted by: (\}l,\_‘; A - &X (/ ffa’j/

b

-

RN

Date:
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Lo&, Terra L

=== o
From: Haines, Matthew R
Sent: Monday, September 19, 2016 3:51 PM
To: Long, Terra L; Owen, Tom
Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Kennedy, Deryk M; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Cherokee Alley

We will accept.
Thank you for your help!

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineer lll

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) | 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Long, Terra L

Sent: Monday, September 19, 2016 3:48 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R; Owen, Tom

Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Kennedy, Deryk M; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Cherokee Alley

CM Owen is willing to use alley match funds of $10,000.00 for this project if you are willing to accept.

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Monday, September 19, 2016 3:45 PM

To: Owen, Tom; Long, Terra L

Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Kennedy, Deryk M; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: Cherokee Alley

CM Owen,

Public Works has fielded various complaints in regards to the alley between Cherokee Rd and Everett Ave running from
Highland Ave and Grinstead Dr. This alley is comprised of pavers and due to being in a historic district, must be repaired
with pavers. Upon our review Public Works estimates that the repair work will be above $20,000.00. We would like to
ask if it would be acceptable for District 8 to request the use of $10,000.00 alley match dollars to complete this repair
work (Maximum you can request is $10,000.00 is my understanding). Public works will contribute the remaining funds
necessary to make the repairs needed.

Please be advised that this work will strictly be repair work and we will not be taking up all pavers. In addition, ADA
ramps will NOT be updated in part of this repair work.

If you could let me know if this will be acceptable and when you may be able to ask for the appropriation, that would be
great.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE



