Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
m Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor; Councilwoman Jessica Green District 1

| Amount: $ 395.00 Date: 10/14/2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funds are being requested to assist with the permit fees for use of the football field @ Russell Lee
Park 3621 Southern Ave ( Sammy Moore Way ) Louisville ,KY 40211 , for The Muhammad Ali
Yellow Jackets Inc  Youth Sports program in district 1 . The mission of the program is to provide
positive role models , teach self respect, encourage academic achievement and set higher
standards for futures of our youth .

City Agency: Metro Parks & Recreations
Contact Person: Marty Storch

Agency Phone: 502 574 6112

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

1 $395.00 10/14/2016
District # e Coﬁhcil Memberéignahn*e Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks & Recreations

Program/Project Name: West End Yellow Jackets , Youth sports
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) ,
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful - |
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Yes

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: %\ Date: 10/14/2016

Revised May 2016



Weathers, Charles

From: Storch, Marty

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 10:22 AM
To: Weathers, Charles

Cc: Johnson, Ben; Williams, Art L.
Subject: Re: West End Yellow Jackets

Yes we would. | have copied art on this to help coordinate
Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 10, 2016, at 10:20 AM, Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Good Morning Gentlemen , | am reaching out to see if Metro Parks would accept fund from District 1 to
assist the West End Yellow Jackets with their permit fees for Russell Lee Park . Thank you C Weathers



IRQ Account Invoice

Printed: 26-Sep-186, 10:29 AM

User: artw
Remit payment to:
Iroquois Amphitheater . |
1080 Amphitheater RD.
Louisville, Ky 40214
invoice #
25-Sep-16 Account #: 334
West End Yellow Jackets
Shawn Donigan Business #: (502) 439-7147
P.O. Box 2666
Louisville KY 40201 USA
Previous Balance $0.00
Rental
25810 - 2016 Football Practice 22-Sep-16
: Total: $395.00
Invoice Balance $395.00 ‘/
Over 120 $395.00 Over 80 $0.00 Over 60 $0.00 Over 30 $0.00 Current $0.00

Page: 1



From: Art.Williams2 @louisvilleky.gov
To: sdonigan40@hotmail.com

Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee
Date: Thu, 5 Nov 2015 14:32:56 +0000
Shawn,

You have a balance of $290 for the permit from this season. | will need you to take care of that and then | can book you
for the next season. You can mail the check to my attention to the address below. Thanks for your attention to this
matter! '

Art Williams

Louisville Metro Parks

1080 Amphitheater Road
Louisville, Kentucky 40214
(502)368-5063 Office
(502)368-5955 Fax
Artl.williams@louisvilleky.gov

From: Shawn Donigan [mailto:sdonigan40@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 05, 2015 9:23 AM

To: Williams, Art L.

Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee

| would like to put in our request for a field permit for practice at Russell Lee Park for the 2016 season. The
dates are from July 5, 2016 thru Nov 18, 2016, Mondays , Tuesdays, Wednesdays and Thursdays, 6:00 pm -
8:00 pm.

Thanks,

Shawn Donigan, President
West End Yellowjackets

From: sdonigan40@hotmail.com

To: art.williams2@louisvilleky.gov
Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee
Date: Thu, 6 Nov 2014 09:16:06 -0500
Ok, Thanks Art

From: Art.Williams2@louisvilleky.gov
To: sdonigan40@hotmail.com
Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee

Date: Thu, 6 Nov 2014 14:12:21 +0000
| have attached your invoice. | believe some of the amounts on here are for the lights a Councilperson was supposed to
pay. Just focus on the 2015 permit for practice.

Art Williams



Weathers, Charles

#

From: Shawn Donigan <sdonigan40@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2016 11:52 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Subject: Fw: Field permit for Russell Lee
Attachments: 10059c02.pdf

From: Williams, Art L. <Art.Williams2 @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 10:30 AM

To: Shawn Donigan

Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee

Invoice attached.

Art Williams

Event Coordinator/Box Office Manager
Louisville Metro Parks

1080 Amphitheater Road

Louisville, Kentucky 40214
(502)368-5063 Office

(502)368-5955 Fax
Artl.williams@louisvilleky.gov

From: Shawn Donigan [mailto:sdonigan40@hotmail.com]
Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 10:09 AM

To: Williams, Art L.

Subject: Re: Field permit for Russell Lee

Hey Art,

Can you send me another copy of our park permit that shows the amount it costs? | need to provide it to
Councilwoman Jessica Green office for them to pay if for us. Or you can send it directly to Councilwoman
Green's office, which ever you prefer.

Thanks,

Shawn Donigan
Yellow Jackets

From: Williams, Art L. <Art.Williams2 @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2015 10:55:05 AM

To: Shawn Donigan

Subject: RE: Field permit for Russell Lee

Nevermind [ see it. It was paid October 19",



Weathers, Charles

_ -
From: Weathers, Charles
Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2016 1:43 PM
To: ‘Shawn Donigan'
Subject: RE: Park Permit Assistance Request

Mr Donigan , can you send me your 501 C3 information so | can get started on your request . C

From: Shawn Donigan [mailto:sdonigan40@hotmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, October 2, 2016 10:27 AM

To: Weathers, Charles

Subject: Park Permit Assistance Request

Here is our official request for assistance.

Thanks,

Shawn Donigan



WEST ENDYELLOW JACKETS INC.

1816 Ratcliffe Avenue
Louisville, Kentucky 40210
© 502/439-7147

October, 3 2016

Councilwoman Jessica Green
Metro Louisville
Louisville, Kentucky

Dear Councilwoman Green:

The West End Youth Yellow Jackets Sports Program is a nonprofit program established
in 1995 and incorporated in 1998. Our mission is to provide positive role models, teach
self-respect, encourage academic achievement and set higher standards for the futures of our
youth. We feel that with the all the violence running rampart within our community, participating
in youth sports is a great deterrent. The coaching staff consists of professional men and women
who serve as friends, counselors, and mentors to approximately 200 children per year. The
West End Youth Yellow Jackets organization’s goals are to teach our children to be competitive
and to form partnerships with families throughout our community.

2015 was a great year for the Yellowjackets organization. We were able to keep our kids
safe and out of harm’s way, by offering our services to a much needed community. Each year
we are responsible for paying Metro Parks for the use of Russell Lee Football Field and its
lights. Because we are a charitable organization, this places us in a financial hardship.

Therefore, we are soliciting you for financial assistance. The service fee for the field
permit is $395.00. As a non-profit 501c3 organization, all contributions made to us are tax
deductible. As our District Councilwoman, you will be placed on our web-site
www leauguelineup.com/jacketpride and Facebook page West End Yellowjacket Youth, as a
gesture of gratitude.

Please consider making a donation and join in our quest to replace self-destruction with
pride and self-respect.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at 502-439-7147.

Sincerely,

Shawn Donigan, President



internal Revenue Service

Depariment of the Treasury
Date: November 4, 2004 P. 0. Box 2508

Cincinnati, OH 45201

Muhammad Ali Jellowjackets Inc. Person to Contact:
% Shawn Donigan : Michelle Jones 31-07675

. 236 Scenic View Dr. Customer Service Specialist
Mt. Washington, KY 40047-6818 Toll Free Telephone Number:

8:00 a.m. 10 6:30 p.m. EST
877-829-5500

Fax Number:
513-263-3756

FWation Number:

This is in response to your request of October 1, 2004, regarding your organization’s tax-
exempt status.

Dear Sir or Madam:

In November 1999 we issued a determination letter that recognized your organization as
exempi from federal income tax. Our records indicate that your organization is curranily
exempt under section 501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code.

Our records indicate that your organization is aiso classified as a public charity under
sections 509(a){1} and 170(b}(1)(A)(vi) of the internal Revenue Code.

Our records indicate that contributions to your organization are deductibie under section 170
of the Code, and that you are qualified to receive tax deductible bequesis, dsvises. iransfers
or gifts under section 2055, 2106 or 2522 of the Internal Revenue Code.

If you have any questions, please call us at the telephone number shown in the heading of
this letter.

Sincerely,

jzmmz% %
Janna K. Skufca, Director, TE/GE
Customer Account Services



NARP
0457804

Alison Lundergan Grimes

Commonwealth of Kentucky | kY secretary of state

Received and Filed

Alison Lundergan Grimes, Secretary @ 4/5/2016 10:36:22 AM

Fee receipt: $15.00

Alison Lundergan Grimes
Secretary of State
P. O. Box 1150
Frankfort, KY 40602-1150
(502) 564-3490

Annual Report ARP
Online Filing -

http://Aww.sos.ky.gov
Company: MUHAMMAD ALI YELLOWJACKETS, INC.
Company ID: 0457804
State of origin: Kentucky

Formation date:
Date filed:
Fee:

Principal Office

6/11/1998 12:00:00 AM
4/5/2016 10:36:22 AM
$15.00

236 Scenic View Drive

Mount Washington, KY 40047

Registered Agent Name/Address

SHAWN DONIGAN
236 SCENIC VIEW DRIVE

MOUNT WASHINGTON, KY 40047

Current Officers

Assistant Treasurer Rober Clayton 236 Scenic View Dr. Mount Washington, Ky 40047
President Shawn Donigan 236 Scenic View Dr. Mount Washington, Ky 40047
Vice President Robert Clayton 236 Scenic View Drive, Mount Washington, Ky 40047
Treasurer Shawn Donigan 236 Scenic View Dr. Mount Washington, Ky 40047
Secretary Tonya Whittaker 236 Scenic View Dr. Mount Washington, Ky 40047
Directors

Director Shawn Donigan 236 Scenic View Drive Mount Washington, Ky 40047
Director Lisa E Donigan 236 Scenic View Drive Mount Washingion, Ky 40047
Director William Carney 236 Scenic View Drive Monunt Washington, Ky 40047
Signatures

Signature Shawn Donigan

Title

President




Orgnzaton'D# 045784 Commonwealth of Kentucky I

State of origin

KY
Filing fee $15.00 Alison Lundergan Grimes, Secretary of State 0457304

Alison Lundergan Grimes
Secretary of State A
P. O. Box 1150 : RA
Erankfort Kat 406021150 Amended 2016 Annual Report
(502) 564-3490
hitp://www.sos.ky.gov

The principal office address and registered agent

Exact organization name and principal office address nameloffice address cannot be changed on this

MUHAMMAD ALI YELLOWJACKETS, INC. form. You can file online at app.sos.ky.goviftsearch

236 SCENIC VIEW DRIVE or forms can be downloaded from our website.
MOUNT WASHINGTON KY 40047 .

Registered Agent and Registered Office Address
SHAWN DONIGAN
236 SCENIC VIEW DRIVE
MOUNT WASHINGTON, KY 40047

Principa| Officers - List the name, address and title of all current officers. Al organizations must list at least one (1) officer, even in the case of a sole officer. If not
specified, officer addresses default to the principal office address. Corporations are required to list a Secretary or other officer serving as records custodian

Assistant Treasurer ROBER CLAYTON

President SHAWN DONIGAN
Vice President ROBERT CLAYTON
Treasurer SHAWN DONIGAN

Directors - Non-profit corporations must have at least three (3) directors. All directors of the non-profit must be listed. If not specified, director addresses default to the principal
office address.

SHAWN DONIGAN
LISA E DONIGAN
WILLIAM CARNEY

Signature of ofcer of chairman of the board (Required) Title (Required) Date (Required)
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Weathers, Charles

From: Williams, Art L.

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 10:44 AM
To: Weathers, Charles

Subject: RE: West End Yellow Jackets

That is the amount owed for the field rental. Were you going to pay for the light usage as well?

Art Williams

Event Coordinator/Box Office Manager
Louisville Metro Parks

1080 Amphitheater Road

Louisville, Kentucky 40214
(502)368-5063 Office

(502)368-5955 Fax
Artl.williams@louisvilleky.gov

From: Weathers, Charles

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 10:36 AM
To: Williams, Art L.

Subject: RE: West End Yellow Jackets

Thank you ,They have sent over an invoice with the account # 334 in the amount of $395.00 , is this the correct amount
owned for the permit to use Russell Lee Park field . Thanks C Weathers

From: Williams, Art L.

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 10:26 AM
To: Storch, Marty; Weathers, Charles

Cc: Johnson, Ben

Subject: RE: West End Yellow Jackets

Charles,

I would be happy to coordinate this for you. Let me know what you need and I will be happy to provide for you!

Art Williams

Event Coordinator/Box Office Manager
Louisville Metro Parks

1080 Amphitheater Road

Louisville, Kentucky 40214
(502)368-5063 Office

(502)368-5955 Fax
Artl.williams@louisvilleky.gov

From: Storch, Marty

Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 10:22 AM
To: Weathers, Charles

Cc: Johnson, Ben; Williams, Art L.
Subject: Re: West End Yellow Jackets
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