Helton, Jessamyn
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From: McQuillen, Liz
Sent: Wednesday, December 7, 2016 2:28 PM
To: Lewis, Chris W; Stenberg, Beth; Helton, Jessamyn
Cc: Blackwell, Rick; Engel, Robin; Stenberg, Beth; Parker, Marilyn
Subject: RE: District 18 - Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements (50 / 50 Cost Sharing Partnership)
Chris — I'll make sure to note the amount and that Beth can speak to this in CM Blackwell’s notes for next week.
Thank you,
Liz

Liz Kennedy McQuillen | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 7. (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

**Please note that my email address has changed to Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov.

From: Lewis, Chris W

Sent: Wednesday, December 07, 2016 12:42 PM

To: McQuillen, Liz; Stenberg, Beth; Helton, Jessamyn

Cc: Blackwell, Rick; Engel, Robin; Stenberg, Beth; Parker, Marilyn

Subject: RE: District 18 - Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements (50 / 50 Cost Sharing Partnership)

Liz,

I think Beth needs to amend the total dollar amount, it's 1250.00 too much.
Also, please allow Beth Stenberg to speak to this item for our office. Thanks!
Chris W. Lewis| Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilwoman Marilyn Parker

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-3463 p: (502) 574-1118

-------- Original message --------

From: "McQuillen, Liz" <Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 12/7/16 12:38 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Stenberg, Beth" <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>, "Helton, Jessamyn"
<Jessamyn.Helton(@louisvilleky.gov>
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Cc: "Blackwell, Rick" <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>, "Engel, Robin" <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky. gov>,
"Lewis, Chris W" <Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: District 18 - Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements (50 / 50 Cost Sharing Partnership)

CM Blackwell approves this addition to the agenda.

Thanks,
Liz

Liz Kennedy McQuillen | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 1 (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

**Please note that my email address has changed to Liz.McQuillen@Iouisvilleky.gov.

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Tuesday, December 06, 2016 5:09 PM

To: Helton, Jessamyn

Cc: Blackwell, Rick; Engel, Robin; Stenberg, Beth; Lewis, Chris W

Subject: FW: District 18 - Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements (50 / 50 Cost Sharing Partnership)

Jess, please place CIF112916PW18 on the next agenda for reconsideration. PW&A told CW Parker they needed
$14,605.09 for their part of that project, but they discovered they underestmimated that estimate by
$2,500. Therefore, the amount needs to be changed from $14,605.09 to $17,105.09.

CM Blackwell, will you please approve for this to be added to the Dec 13 agenda since the project is underway and the
funding is needed.

Thank you,

Beth

From: Taghizadeh, Mojgan

Sent: Tuesday, December 06, 2016 2:04 PM

To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: Adams, Mark; Parker, Marilyn; Lewis, Chris W; Bradley, Maxwell B.

Subject: RE: District 18 - Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements (50 / 50 Cost Sharing Partnership)

Beth, As a Follow up to our phone conversation yesterday, I'm sending you a summary Table showing funding &
Expenditure info for D18 projects.

Please note that the remaining balance in Hurstbourne/Bunsen project is less than what | initially reported($3,444.79-
$1,200= $2,244.79). | had to keep $1,200 in Hurstbourne/Bunsen account to cover for the cost of bench which has been
ordered but not yet installed.

Also, $50,000 shown as Hurstbourne/Shelbyvillle /Shelby Campus project total is the estimated cost and NOT the actual
cost of the project. Our Contractor has not yet submitted the final invoice for this project.

Hope the information below is helpful and answers your questions. Let me know if you have any additional questions.

Mojgan Taghizadeh
502.574.3873



Hurstbourne/Shelbyvillle

/Shelby Campus

$50,000
Estimated cost
pre-construction

$25,000.00

525,000.00

Total=549,501.33 /

+$2,244.80

+$ 4,156.60

+514,605.05
Total=523,800

52,793.51%

project Project Total TARC's share 50% | D18's share 50% CIF amount Rem
Oxmoor Lane 5?,4'1&9"5:4 $12,089.82 $12,085.82 $14,883.33
Inatl Los
5 2,733.83
+$20,358.86 ,
Hurstbourne/Bunsen $?4,i 1}37 547,256.54 547,256.54 +55,790.1% '
e +31661845 |/




