Print Form ]

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
feighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler [

| Amount: $13,500 Date: January 18, 2017 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Map match funding for paving the alley between Craig Ave and Wheeler Ave, from Carlisle Ave to
Camden Ave.

$10,000 AbPmatch 8126-410-8105-148947-822815
$13,500 CIF D15
Total $23,500

City Agency: public Works

Contact Person: Mathew Haines, PE

Agency Phone: 502 574-3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

18 lE] ! bO January, 18, 20°}%%
District # Council Member Sigdature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: _ Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works, Alley match paving

Program/Project Name: Craig Ave and Wheeler Ave from Carlisle Ave to Camden Ave.
) Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) |

Appropriating Funding? | Yes

=y

' Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

' account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of i
the request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they ,
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

d I [

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. . Yes El
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000?7 If so, an ordinance is required. . No E
~ Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
~ If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA E!
e B - .
. Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes El
Submitted by: shughes Date: 1-18-17

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Thursday, January 12, 2017 11:58 AM
To; Stenberg, Beth

Ce: Butler, Marianne; Luckett, Daniel R
Subject: FW: Alley resurfacing-SR#4657817-LPWE

Beth, District 15 is requesting to utilize 10K alley match funding for the alley between Craig Ave & Wheeler Ave, from
Carlisle Ave to Camden Ave. | will submit the CIF appropriation prior to deadline. Thanks, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Thursday, January 12, 2017 11:49 AM

To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: Alley resurfacing-SR#4657817-LPWE

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, January 11, 2017 2:44 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R __

Subject: RE: Alley resurfacing-SR#4657817-LPWE

Daniel,
1 am coming up with an estimate of $23,500.00 to repave this alley.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineer lll

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, January 10, 2017 12:13 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: FW: Alley resurfacing-SR#4657817-LPWE

Hi Mr. Haines!
Can you re-send me the estimate for this alley? Thank you Sir!

From: MetroCall

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2016 2:14 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: Alley resurfacing-SR#4657817-LPWE

Daniel,



We have submitted the request to Public Works for a response and follow-up.

MetroCall 311

311 or 574-5000
MetroCall@LouisvilleKy.gov
www.LouisvilleKy.qov/MetroCall

o s 50 i
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Please reply to this email if you would like for your contact information to remain confidential. Thank you.

NOTICE of CONFIDENTIALITY: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this e-mail is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any
review, use, disclosure, distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all forms of the original message.

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2016 11:41 AM
To: MetroCall

Subject: Alley resurfacing

Our District 15 office is requesting an estimate to resurface the alley running between Craig Ave & Wheeler Ave, from
Carlisle Ave to Camden Ave. This alley needs to be resurfaced with a slight crown to move standing water from side to
side, front to back. Thank you for your help in this matter!



Metro Map Viewer

SELECTEON ~ TODLSE » IDENRTIFY= | HMAPSy RBSDw | HELP+

Scals: 111,200




Hughes, Susan W‘ M -

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2017 4:39 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Emailing: CRAIG WHEELER pav .pdf

Susan - please sign for the Alley paving - thanks! Marianne

From: Hughes, Susan
Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2017 3:10 PM
To: Butler, Marianne
Subject: Emailing: CRAIG WHEELER pav .pdf

| need signature authority fo submit my deadline.

0

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:
CRAIG WHEELER pav .pdf
Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or

receiving certain types of file attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine
how attachments are handled.



