Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: RBuclocra Sexteon Swmi it

| Amount: Date: [/20//7

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s): { jaced
o5 € {) [ ol

Noperary sdcecet sign for Michae] 7. wWhite ¢

on West Tefferson sHreed at 224 street andd ad
2YR Shreet. Twe signs will be nsdalled gad one
sign will be grvea o prichqel T white's Samily.

City Agency: . Llic WarKs
Contact Person: [Kenpne4h - 5 \fMj hter Te fhrey Brown

Agency Phone: o . . S 7Y -~0oks

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

U B e Cdnir] #5647 ifochiz

District # /Council Megy’%q‘? Signdture Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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~ NDF,CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name:

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? -
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with ;
account numbers in the request form description? - /\///ff

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? - N / /

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? N /f /;
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville '
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the —_— /
funding source is probably NDF. I 7{4
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. - N / 4
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. — No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - N / [}
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid s
estimate and description of cost? - \/ €5

-
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Sexton Smith, Barbara

S A R G BRSSO A
From: Sexton Smith, Barbara

Sent: Friday, January 20, 2017 2:35 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Micheal White street name sign

Thank you so much!

Barbara.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Friday, January 20, 2017 1:56 PM

To: Chism, Evadne S.; Sexton Smith, Barbara
Subject: Fwd: Micheal White street name sign

You can use this as the cost estimate

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Roades, Bonnie J" <Bonnie.Roades@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: 1/20/17 1:49 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Brown, Jeffrey E" <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>, "Jennings, Patricia A"
<Patricia.Jennings@]louisvilleky.gov>, "Slaughter, Kenneth G." <Kenneth.Slaughter@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Micheal White street name sign

Jeff -
Per our conversation, here is a quote for one sign that we did the end last of the year for CD6:

(1) Honorary Street Name sign = $188.00 (this cost includes all material, fabricate and installation).
| think that a typical scenario for these kinds of signs is a total of three signs - two to hang and one for the recipient. But
| think that depends on each individual case. '

Thanks

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Friday, January 20, 2017 1:30 PM

To: Roades, Bonnie J; Jennings, Patricia A; Slaughter, Kenneth G.
Subject: Fwd: Micheal White street name sign

Can you guys work up a per sign estimate RIGHT NOW?




From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Friday, January 20, 2017 8:48 AM

To: Jennings, Patricia A; Slaughter, Kenneth G.; Roades, Bonnie ]
Cc: Chism, Evadne S.; Hall, Barbara C

Subject: Micheal White street name sign

Do you guys have a status update on the Michael White Street Name Sign for District 4?

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE
Assistant Director of Public Works
444 5 5" st, 4™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-0065

Cell (502)773-3222
Jeffrey.brown@louisvilleky.gov




