Wohl, Geoff

From: Koetter, Maria C

Sent: Friday, February 17, 2017 11:21 AM
To: Wohl, Geoff

Cc: Mulvihill, Patrick; Feltner, Sara N.
Subject: RE: CIF Funds for the removal of a tree.
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Geoff,

I affirm that a $1,500 appropriation is for the removal of a diseased tree located at 828 Fetter Avenue.
Please let me know if this information is acceptable to address your request.

Many thanks,
Maria

Maria Koetter

Director, Office of Sustainability
Develop Louisville-Louisville Forward
Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 6th Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

502-574-4148

From: Wohl, Geoff

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2017 2:39 PM
To: Koetter, Maria C

Cc: Mulvihill, Patrick; Feltner, Sara N.
Subject: CIF Funds for the removal of a tree.

Maria,

Could you please send an email response affirming that this office should appropriate $1,500 of CIF funds to be sent to
your office for the removal of the tree at 828 Fetter Ave. that was diseased and located in the public ROW. We are in
possession of a check from the constituent payable to Metro Louisville for $500 as their portion of this expense. | need
something from your office to submit with the paperwork that goes to the Appropriations Committee. Thanks very
much.

Geoff Wohl

Legislative Assistant

Councilman Pat Mulvihill, District 10
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1110
geoff.wohl@louisvilleky.gov




