Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

PrintForm |

| Primary Sponsor: BRENT T. ACKERSON

| Amount: $3500.00

Date: 03/03/2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
TRANSFERS $3500.00 FROM THE 26TH DISTRICT NDF TO THE LMPD SIXTH DIVISION FOR
OVERTIME PAY IN THE HIGHGATE SPRINGS NEIGHBORHOOD AS ASSIGNED BY MAJOR
TANDETA HETTICH.

Agency Phone: 502.574-2187

City Agency: [ OUISVILLE METRO POLICE DEPARTMENT

Contact Person: \aJOR TANDETA HETTICH

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

26 (L‘MM?

Y $3500.00 03/03/2017
District # Cothcil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Request Amount:

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Amended Amount:
To OMB:

Account #:

To Project Manager:
Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LOUISVILLE METRO POLICE DEPARTMENT

Program/Project Name: HIGHGATE SPRINGS OVERTIME

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

Yes/No/NA

Yes

- account numbers in the request form description? NA ﬂ
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they :
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF. -
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
~ life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA B
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? NA
Submitted by: [/mb (Z—A Date: 03/03/2017
\_ j /

Revised May 2016




Noble, Jeffrey T

From: Hettich, Tandeta

Sent: Friday, February 24, 2017 2:29 PM
To: Noble, Jeffrey T

Subject: RE: Overtime money

Yes we can do that....you are correct on the time to get the money moved to our budget.

Sent from my Verizon 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Noble, Jeffrey T" <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: 2/24/17 2:04 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Hettich, Tandeta" <Tandeta.Hettich@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Overtime money

Maj. Hettich —

Councilman Ackerson is interested in funding some overtime, approximately $2800.00, to increase police presence in a
particular area of the district, responding to the break-ins and other problems in the Highgate Springs area. We have
previously done this for speeding in the Klondike Lane area. I'd very much like your input on this. The idea would be to
spend this money in the next two or three months. Although ideally we’d start spending it right away, realistically, it
must go through the Appropriations process here at the Council which at a minimum takes a month.

Your thoughts?

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Aide to Councilman Brent T. Ackerson
26" Council District

601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318

Louisville, Kentucky 40202

502-574-1126

ielfrey.noble@louisvilleky.gov




Noble, Jeffrey T

From: Brent Ackerson <brent@kyfirm.com>
Sent: : Friday, March 3, 2017 12:57 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T

Subject: RE: Increase for NDF

Yes. Thanks.

From: Noble, Jeffrey T [mailto:Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Friday, March 03, 2017 12:48 PM

To: Brent Ackerson

Subject: Increase for NDF

Brent —

Please verify you wanted to increase this from $2800 to $3500.

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Aide to Councilman Brent T. Ackerson
26" Council District

601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318

Louisville, Kentucky 40202

502-574-1126

jcffrev.noble@louisvillcky.gov




