Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Ald Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV) L
{ Primary Sponsor: (v ca lWUovmai Che 'qu ant A A [ |
Amount:  # ZJ T/ Date: 3!&3_/}7 J

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
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I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have .

determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the sttached
documentation from the recelving department concerning the project/expenditure,

-~

5 (Ueee A on Mo $9170% 3-23-7
Amount Date '

District # Council Member Signature

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
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Reference #: To OMB:
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Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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~ NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
 Interagency Name: Diy 1S 1o 6 € Commern N Fo rf;%?.. Lo dsv' e F'o_rmrﬁ
Program/Project Name: Ty s e + 'J-u»ywp reme o ea -gt‘f--h%dS
| Yes/No/NA
: Requut Form: Is the Request Signed by aii Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? - >/zo 5
Request Form: If matehing funds are 1o be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? | . /V ;}
| Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of |
the request exclude the matching fund amount? , — W ,4_
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they i
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? i ) %
Funding Source: if CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the - // #
funding source is probably NDF,
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ W p3
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Meiro Agency greater than
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. - A
' Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF 1o cost center? :
If 30, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - N
| Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

! estimate and description of cost?
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Hamilton, Cheri

m

From: Pulliam, Lee W

Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2017 10:14 AM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Ce Friend-Ellis, Myra; Thompson, Erin
Subject: RE: District 5 Tree Removal Cost Estimates
Yes mam,

From: Hamilton, Cherj

Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2017 10:12 AM

To: Pulliam, Lee W

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra; Thompson, Erin

Subject: Re: District 5 Tree Removal Cost Estimates

Does that also include removal of the stumps?
On Mar 23, 2017, at 9:49 AM, "Pulliam, Lee W" <Lee Pulliam@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
Hello Councilwoman Hamiiton,
| have secured two separate cost estimates from the city tree contractor for removals to be performed

at the addresses listed below. Please let us know when the funds are appropriated so we can schedule
the work to be performed. Once the work has been completed then we will et you know.

Address Species _ Cost
915 Southwestern Parkway 42" Siberian Elm 51,920
2918 W. Main Streat 45” Pin oak $2,250

Respectfully,
Lee
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Lee Pulliam

Community Forestry Arborist

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0791A

Division of Community Forestry-Louisvilie Forward
527 West Jefferson St, Suite 605

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-3383

Lee.Pulliam@louisvilleky.gov
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