Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler -

[ Amount: $750.00 , Date: April 10, 2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Rabies Clinic with Animal Services to protect animals from disease.

City Agency: {\_nimal_s_ervif:?‘s .
Contact Person; Ozzy Gibson

Agency Phone: 502-363-6609

1 have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

e P
15 { ) )fml "y gé% $750.00 April 10, 2017
District # Council Member Sighature Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Program/Project Name: Rabies Clinic
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

‘Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville :
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the L ONA
funding source is probably NDF. ‘

Funding Source: If CTF is being requested, does the project have a useful |

' life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
“Ordinance Required: Ts the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than |
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. . No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
. If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? . No
. Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? ; Yes
Submitted by: - shughes Date: Apr6, 2017

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

From: Gibson, Ozzy

Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2017 9:11 AM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

| accept...out | had a typo:{ ..ughhh.itis $750 ...that is what it was last year.
Best ozzy

--—Qriginal Message-——

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Thursday, April 06, 2017 8:32 AM
To: Butler, Marianne; Gibson, Ozzy
Cc: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

Hi Ozzy, by reply to this message, | will be able to process the $700 for the clinic. This is great
news. Thank you,

Susan

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Wednesday, April 05, 2017 6:45 PM
To: Gibson, Ozzy

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Hughes, Susan
Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

Sure

From: Gibson, Ozzy

Sent: Wednesday, April 05, 2017 5:10 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

Hello, would you be able to do this on May 20the

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Tuesday, April 04, 2017 8:48 AM

To: Gibson, Ozzy

Cc: Kalkhof, Skip; Hughes, Susan; Luckett, Daniel R
Subject: RE: Rabies clinics



Whichever works best for you -- late May or June 17. We will get you the money and let me
know the date so we can do a flier. If the other dates are close to it - let me know those as
well and we can do one flier.

Thanks! Marianne

From: Gibson, Ozzy

Sent: Tuesday, April 04, 2017 8:03 AM

To: Butler, Marianne

Cc: Kalkhof, Skip

Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

We have one scheduled for June 10th....we can fry June 17th or do you want to do one in
May? If we can use the fruck price is $700!

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Friday, March 31, 2017 9:31 AM
To: Gibson, Ozzy

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R; Hughes, Susan
Subject: RE: Rabies clinics

Sounds great! We always do it at Wyandotte Park by the old pool house -- does June 10 or
June 17 work? Maybe we can do each weekend in June and @ big presser for it.

Thanks for thinking of me -- let me know how much

Marianne

From: Gibson, Ozzy

Sent: Friday, March 31,2017 7:18 AM

To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: FW: Rabies clinics

Well some greatf news, | have been working fo partner with Pets for life to use their vehicle for
rabies clinics...... this is a state of the art vet vehicle! We will be doing our first{trial run) one
using the fruck April 25th at Animal House. This is way better than the old spot frailer. If you
want to do it, get me some dates and | will coordinate with them. We can take this any
place. | would suggest some place with parking for citizens and restirooms. Councilwomen
Flood and Welch will be doing one in June...... maybe if we lock in your date we do some
press for it, coordinated with them.

Ozzy
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