Print Form

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Barbara E Shanklin |

| Amount: $345,000 Date: 6/15/17 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

These funds will be used for the rehabilitation of and installation of two baseball fields at Newburg
Park. This will include (but limited to) re-grading and sodding of fields (x2), fence lines and
backstops (x2), scoreboard and lighting.

City Agency: parks
Contact Person: jz50n Canuel

Agency Phone: 574.5086

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?
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Smelser-Dearing, Jared

From: Storch, Marty

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2017 10:54 AM
To: Smelser-Dearing, Jared

Subject: RE: funds transfer

We certainly will accept these funds so we can get this project moving forward. thanks we keep chipping away at
master plan.

From: Smelser-Dearing, Jared

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2017 10:03 AM
To: Storch, Marty

Subject: funds transfer

Hi Marty, thanks for helping get this off the ground. | spoke to CW Shanklin and she is requesting that parks accept
$345,000 for the Newburg Park baseball fields. If you could send me an email confirmation that Parks will accept those
funds I'll start that process on my end. Thanks again -Jared

Jared Smelser-Dearing

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Dr. Barbara Shanklin
Council District 2

Louisville, Ky

(502) 574-2787
jared.dearing@louisvilleky.gov




PETERSBURG PARK SOFTBALL FIELD RENOVATIONS

Metro Parks & Recreation
Bid tab summary

Date: 05-25-17

By: jtc

Number of
days to
complete
Supplier project Base Bid

E-Z Construction Co. 120 $ 468,900.00
Pace Contracting, LLC 90 $ 370,000.00
|Riverside Paving & Contracting 63 $ 345,000.00 |
Woodbine Construction 60 $ 356,974.95

|Recommend to award the base bid to Riverside Paving for $345,000.




