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Lewis, Chris W

From: Jim Leidgen <jim@hurstbourne.org>
Sent: Thursday, September 7, 2017 3:39 PM
To: Lewis, Chris W
Cc: Trisha Sikkema
Subject: FW: NDF to City of Hurstbourne
Attachments: 2011_11-19_MUNICIPAL_ORDER_CITY OF 

HURSTBOURNE_PARTICIPATION_METRO_FUNDING.pdf

Importance: High

I think the attached M.O. should cover what is needed. The funds will come from the approved 2017-18 Budgeted 
expenses (Public Works Department) – See last line item highlighted. 
Tax and other revenues will fund this project. What other than a statement to that effect do you need? 
Can you attach this email to page 7? 
 
Thanks! 
 
Jim Leidgen 
City Administrative Officer 
City of Hurstbourne 
200 Whittington Parkway, Ste 100 
Louisville, KY 40222 
(502) 426-4808 
www.hurstbourne.org 
 
 
 

PUBLIC WORKS    June 30, 2014 AUDIT   June 30, 2015 AUDIT   June 30, 2016 AUDIT

G/L Account Category / Name G/L   Budget Actual Variance   Budget Actual Variance   Budget Actual
                
Landscaping                
Landscaping Other 60920   $1,000  $0  $1,000    $1,000  $0  $1,000    $1,000  

Arborist 60930   $23,000  $21,515  $1,485    $23,000  $20,647  $2,353    $22,000  

Contract Gardener 60940   $175,000  $121,561  $53,439    $175,000  $108,389  $66,611    $135,000  $115,582 

Subtotal:    $199,000  $143,076  $55,924    $199,000  $129,036  $69,964    $158,000  $135,040 

Spring/Fall Planting                
Flowers 60710   $20,000  $18,037  $1,963    $20,000  $13,876  $6,124    $15,000  

Plant Replacements 60720   $20,000  $18,009  $1,991    $20,000  $35,297  ($15,297)   $20,000  

Mulch 60730   $32,000  $26,367  $5,633    $32,000  $26,507  $5,493    $30,000  

Tree Replacement 60740   $30,000  $3,141  $26,859    $30,000  $29,729  $271    $25,000  

Tree Removal 60750   $20,000  $9,264  $10,736    $30,000  $27,023  $2,977    $30,000  

Subtotal:    $122,000  $74,818  $47,182    $132,000  $132,432  ($432)   $120,000  $106,366 

City Properties                
Storm Water     $10,000  $6,666  $3,334    $10,000  $0  $10,000    $0  

Side Walk Repair     $5,000  $5,395  ($395)   $5,000  $6,419  ($1,419)   $0  
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From: Lewis, Chris W [mailto:Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov]  
Sent: Thursday, September 07, 2017 2:23 PM 
To: Trisha Sikkema; Jim Leidgen 
Subject: FW: NDF to City of Hurstbourne 
 
 

Jim, 
  
See the email from our county attorney below regarding the sidewalk NDF application. Can you list the source of the 
other funds on page 7 and resubmit that page as well as provide the city of Hurstbourne’s ordinance opting into the 
Metro Partnership as request by the county attorney? Sorry for the difficulties.. Thanks  
  
  

Chris W. Lewis | Legislative Assitant 
Office of Councilwoman Marilyn Parker 
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202 
p: (502) 574-1118  f: (502) 574-4501 
District 18 Website  
  

  
  

From: Lococo, Nicholas  
Sent: Wednesday, September 6, 2017 6:04 PM 
To: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov> 
Cc: Martin, Sarah J <Sarah.Martin@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov> 
Subject: NDF to City of Hurstbourne 
  
Chris, 
  
I’ve uploaded and approved the ordinance into Granicus, but I wanted to inform you that the City of Hurstbourne 
Municipal Order opting into the Metro Partnership needs to be added.  This documentation is necessary for compliance 
with LMCO 97.100.  Also, on Page 7, the City lists additional funding of $54,000, but does not specify the source of these 
funds. 
  
Please update this information. 
  
Thanks, 
Nick 
  
  

 
Nicholas J. Lococo 
Assistant Jefferson County Attorney 
Office of Mike O'Connell – Jefferson County Attorney 
O: (502) 574-6333 



3

D: (502) 574-6876 
F: (502) 574-6039 
531 Court Pl., Ste. 900 
Louisville, KY 40202 
  
This electronic message contains information from the Office of Mike O'Connell, the Jefferson County Attorney, which 
may contain confidential or privileged information.  If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, 
distribution or use of the contents of this message is prohibited.  If you have received this electronic transmission in 
error, please advise the sender immediately by reply e-mail and delete this message and any attachments without 
retaining a copy or forwarding it.  Please return any hard copies to the address above. Neither the transmission of this 
message or any attachment, nor any error in transmission or misdelivery shall constitute waiver of any applicable legal 
privilege.  
  
 

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the 
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, 
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. 








