Print Form

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Dan Johnson |

| Amount: $2895.00 Date: 8/21/2017 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Place a black granite bench on the Iroquois Branch Library grounds as a memorial to Louisville
Police Officer Nick Rodman who lost his life in the line of duty.

City Agency: Louisville Free Public Library
Contact Person: Belinda Catman

Agency Phone: 574-1845

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
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Revised May 2016

Page |



Manlex, Rax i}

From: Belinda Catman <Belinda.Catman®@Ifpl.org>
Sent: Monday, September 11, 2017 10:16 AM

To: Manley, Ray

Cc: Johnson, Dan D; Blanton, Jim; Foster, Doug
Subject: RE: Rodman Bench

Hi Ray,

Yes the library will accept the funds from Councilman Johnson to proceed with the project of installing the
commemorative bench for Officer Rodman.

Thanks
Belinda

From: Manley, Ray [mailto:Ray.Manley@Ilouisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Monday, September 11, 2017 10:05 AM

To: Catman, Belinda

Cc: Johnson, Dan D -

Subject: Rodman Bench

This is to confirm that the Louisville Free Public Library will accept the $2895 funding from Councilman Johnson to place
a bench commemorating Louisville Metro Police Officer Nick Rodman who was recently killed in the line of duty.

Ray Manley
District 21
Staff Helper

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.



Department/Project:

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpese.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Inrte_ragency Name:

Program/Project Name:

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) J
Appropriating Funding? w= {27
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with "/ /
account numbers in the request form description? i
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of (
the request exclude the matching fund amount? A o
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they i

/

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? -

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the — N 44
funding source is probably NDF. |

‘Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. - Y [ 4
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF féqiiéét to a Metro Agency 'grea'ter than

$5.,000? If so, an ordinance is required. | o= /\}O
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? - /
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25.000 or less? --= ﬁ w4

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid | _
estimate and description of cost? | %/ S

Submitted by: &,&«.’%@) (’\Md — Date: (/1{ ff’// ¥
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