Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

Print Form

| Primary Sponsor: Rick Blackwell

| Amount: $7,000 Date: 9/28/2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding of sidewalk repairs rated 4 & 5 in District 12 at several locations: 3709 Baymeadow, 6201
Krause Avenue, 6701 Everton, 2416 Royster, 2412 Royster, 2405 Royster, 6605 Cady, 7806
Kenhurst, 7913 Kenhurst, 9809 Brooksben, 9811 Brooksbend, 7829 Texlyn, 7811 Texlyn, 5714
Arvis, 5800 Arvis, 9616 Inca, 9607 Inca, 9606 Inca, 9608 Inca, 9605 Cochise Way.

Total estimate for repair of these 20 locations will be combined with $25,000 in District 12

Sidewalk Repair Account.

City Agency: Metro Public Works & Assets.

Contact Person: craig Allen

Agency Phone: 502 574.6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

o /?‘

o $7,000.00 9/28/2017

District # ouncil Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: District 12 Sidewalk Repair Funding at several locations

' o ‘ ' Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signéd by all Council Mélhber(s) -
Appropriating Funding? Yes E
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA IZl
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA B
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes B
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville -
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Vos |Z|
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than :
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? R
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA IEJ
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes E]

Submitted by: % WWM
v T

Date: 9/28/2017

Revised May 2016



McQuillen, Liz

From: McQuillen, Liz

Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 1:58 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Cc: McQuillen, Liz; Blackwell, Rick

Subject: RE: D12 Sidewalk Repairs

Craig —

Councilman Blackwell has committed to funding the $7000 from CIF for the total estimate of $32,000 for the sidewalk
repairs you listed in the original email.

We'll et the paperwork submitted and have this added late to the Appropriations Committee agenda for Wednesday
10/3/17 as it is time-sensitive.

Please let us know if you are able to get the estimates together for the other three requests before then.

Thank you,
Liz McQuillen

Liz McQuillen | Legisiative Aide

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1112 0 (502) 574-3363

www.RickBlackwell.com

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 12:49 PM
To: McQuillen, Liz

Subject: RE: D12 Sidewalk Repairs

Hi Liz,

That’s a great question. If | can have the assurance that Councilman Blackwell’s $7,000 will pass council I'll definitely
add this work into the current deployment. | originally had planned the 25,000 for the spring, as you probably
know. But as long as the $7,000 is coming I'll contact the contractor as soon as | hear back from you.

I'm pretty slammed right now, but I will try to get those four estimates tomorrow. As long as I'm able to get those
estimates tomorrow I'll Osend those to you tomorrow and maybe you can add those four to the $7,000.

Thanks,

Craig Allen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works
574-6159

From: McQuillen, Liz
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 11:55 AM



To: Allen, Craig L
Cc: McQuillen, Liz
Subject: RE: D12 Sidewalk Repairs

Good Afternoon Craig —
| was able to speak with CM Blackwell and he would like to fund these — seems like a good bang for our buck.

| wanted to know if these locations will be taken care of with the current contractor work that's happening now? Or if
this will be a different contractor deployment?

Also, | just entered the attached 4 sidewalk repair estimates {1 on Deady Drive and 3 on Mavis Court). Is it possible to
include these in those estimates if they rate high/low enough?

Thanks!
Liz McQuillen

Liz McQuillen ' Legisiative Aide

Office of Councitman Rick Blackwell

601 W. Jefferson Street  Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1112 0 (502) 574-3363

www . RickBlackwell.com

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 11:23 AM
To: McQuillen, Liz

Subject: D12 Sidewalk Repairs

Liz,

I worked up an estimate for the known 4’s and 5’s in District 12. Just about all of these were noted while | was in the
field yesterday. The total is $32,000. The sidewalk repair budget will cover $25,000 of that total can Councilman
Blackwell appropriate the remaining $7,000? Here is a list of the addresses.

3709 Baymeadow Dr
6201 Krause Ave
6701 Everton
2416 Royster
2412 Royster
2405 Royser
6605 Cady

7806 Kenhurst
7913 Kenhurst
9809 Brooksbend
9811 Brooksbend
7829 Texlyn
7811 Texlyn
5714 Arvis

5800 Arvis

9616 Inca

9607 Inca

9606 Inca

9608 Inca



9605 Cochise Way

Thanks,

Engineer [

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-6159

Fax: (502) 574-4129



