Louisville Metro Council
Originated NDF

Print Form

f 5 4
| Primary Council Member: /{4, | {z N

| Appropriation Amount: 7 /7 5?" ,. o0

Specifically describe the charge to NDF attaching supporting documentation to fully
describe the expenditure and describe the public purpose:

/W&W/EJ{,“J.

Entity Hosting Event: %Qﬂ-—"—‘—*«v—a’ 0l b, Arne
Entity Mailing Address: 4309 Z4J. Max_f

Entity Contact: 12"—?/-‘4 v e el s e

Contact Phone: £,/ _ 5.!_/ Lf‘ 8/5 /3

Attachment required:
+ Sponsorship of an event: Attach an event flyer and/or details regarding how the
event was publicized.
* Admittance to an Event: Attach a list of persons whose admission was paid by
this expenditure.

+ Fundraiser: Specifically disclose how the net proceeds of this fundraiser will be
used.

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.

5 Chei B Hamb 390°° 29/

District # Primary Sponsor Signature Amount Date

Appropriations Committee Chair Date

List below any persconal or business relationship you, your family or your legislative assistant have
with this organization, its volunteers, its employees or members of its board of directors.

Effective May 2016



Applicant/Program:

List below any personal or business relationship you, your family or your legislative assistant
have with this organization, its volunteers, its employees or members of its board of directors.

District 1 $
District 2 $
District 3 $
District 4 $
District 5 — i $
District 6 W% 5. L bp. 2=
District 7 $
District 8 $
District 9 $
District 10 $
District 11 5
District 12 $
District 13 $
District 14 $
District 15 $

Effective May 2016



Yearlings Club Incorporated

INVOICE

YEARLINGS CLUB INC.
4309 West Broadway Street
Louisville Kentucky 40211
Tax ID # 61-1301432

1. Client Councilwoman Cheri Bryant Hamilton

2. Ten (10) -65% Anniversary Gala tickets ($65.00 per tickets) = $650.00.
Saturday, November 4, 2017, 9 pm-lam
Crowne Plaza, Airport Expo Center
830 Phillips Lane
Louisville, Kentucky 40209

3. Total amMOUNE OWE. . ..eenneeeeeeee et eeeet et raraseaeaaeeeannneeasaeetenaans $650.00

Please make all checks payable to the Yearlings Club Inc. and mail to:
Yearlings Club Inc.
4309 West Broadway
Louisville, Kentucky 40211
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4309 West Broadway, Louisville, KY 40211 (502) 775~
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Hamilton, Cheri

From: Roger Wilson <RWilson@JeffersonCountyClerk.org>
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 4:19 PM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: Yearlings

The purpose of the funds is to allow the Yearlings Club Inc. to (1) continue hosting community forums, activities, and events that educate, inform and
empower community residents (2) allow neighborhood organizations to hold their monthly meetings and other activities at the Clubhouse and (3) provide
financial assistance {depending on the funds raised ) to community groups such as the West Louisville ministries, Boy Scout Troop 82 and college students.

From: Hamilton, Cheri [mailto:Cheri.Hamilton@Iouisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 3:55 PM

To: Roger Wilson <RWilson@JeffersonCountyClerk.org>

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra <Myra.Friend-Ellis@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Yearlings

Just forward something on the public purpose of the event, scholarship fundraiser, is what | thought | remembered.

From: Roger Wilson [mailto:RWilson@JeffersonCountyClerk.org]
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 3:35 PM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: Yearlings

Please see attached. Thanks Roger

From: Hamilton, Cheri [mailto:Cheri.Hamilton@Iouisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 3:17 PM

To: Roger Wilson <RWilson@JeffersonCountyClerk.org>

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra <Myra.Friend-Ellis@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Yearlings

| need a copy of the invoice or announcement about the Nov. 4™ event so we can process the table for payment. Can you send me or Myra the info we need
with name, place, date, ticket/table amount, etc.



Finance Public Purpese Purchasing Policy

Public Purpose Intent to Purchase
Required to accompany purchase up to $10,000 including $2,500 or less

Authorization by (check one): Director Other (specify) -

Vendor/supplier Information

Legal Name of vendor/contractor: % LAME* el \41&44
Address: 4309 V. MJ
City/ State & Zip: WLQ. W %OZ 174

Contact Person Name & Telephone Number:

Ll SR SYY-45\D

N N

Metro Department Information

Requesting Department: W g

Contact Person Name & Telephone: Hiren 574 - 245

Public Purpose Information

Name of event; wﬂ'! b ol gl ala
Venue for event: G)u.,u«\—yuuﬂ La/;{au '

9. Publlc purpose served: (attach separate explanation if needed)
10. -Identify fund source by name and account -

E

11. Account coding:

"
12. $ Amount__( 50°

. List of attendees/participants in event: (attach separate sheet if. needed) . ) ; _
aw Hone i) Qs frvpie %QWMS*Z‘JT Jueilfemss
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Authorizations

Department Director: Date:

Signature certifies:

Funds are available

If grant funded, purchase meets all grant guidelines and requirements
Public purpose is being served by this expenditure

Created May 2008




