Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

Print Form

| Primary Sponsor: Cindi Fowler

| Amount: $4,210 Date: 10/19/2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Installation of two LED flashing lights in the area of 15301 Dixie Highway - for southbound traffic at
LG&E and northbound traffic at CEMEX, two intersections where there is heavy commercial traffic.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 5740065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount; Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Program/Project Name: LED flashing lights at 15301 Dixie Highway

= MBI~ . Ve NoINA—
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) . =
Appropriating Funding? - Yes

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
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; . Yes
funding source is probably NDF,
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the ?.o_.m.o.ﬂ have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF, - Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF qogzmmﬁ to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?  NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
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Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindy L

S
From: Sparks, Stuart
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 1:50 PM
To: Fowler, Cindi
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Johnson, Pat W
Subject: RE: flashing truck warning on Dixie

CW Fowler,

Per our phone conversation, we will proceed with replacing the outside advance warning signs with LED flashing signs.
The cost of the project will be $4,210. We will work with KYTC to acquire a permit for this project.

Thanks,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 12:30 PM
To: Sparks, Stuart

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Johnson, Pat W
Subject: Re: flashing truck warning on Dixie

Will that work?
Sent from my iPad

>0n Oct 10, 2017, at 12:10 PM, Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

>

> | don't want to replace but erect new ones north of LGE and south of CEMEX

>

> Sent from my iPad

>

>>0n Oct 10, 2017, at 12:01 PM, Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:
>>

>> Just to make sure | understand correctly, you want to replace (2) of the truck warning signs. One at each end (for
southbound traffic at LG&E and northbound traffic at CEMEX). Is this correct?

>>

>> Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

>> Louisville Metro Public Works

>> Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings

>> 601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

>> (502) 574-3650



>>>>

>>>>

>>>>

>>>> ---——-0riginal Message-----

>>>> From: Fowler, Cindi

>>>> Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 11:37 AM

>>>> To: Sparks, Stuart

>>>> Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Johnson, Pat W

>>>> Subject: Re: flashing truck warning on Dixie

>>>>

>>>> S0 no words, just truck pic?

>>>>

>>>> Sent from my iPad

>>>>

>>>>>0n Oct 10, 2017, at 11:33 AM, Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

>2>5>

>>>>> Correct. The sign dimensions and layout would be exactly the same. The border would have LED's and would be
solar powered.

255>

>>>>> Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

>>>>> Louisville Metro Public Works

>>>>> Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings

>>>>> 601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

>>>>> (502) 574-3650

>23>>

22>>>

>>>>>

S>55> —mnee Original Message-----

>>>>> From: Fowler, Cindi

>>>>> Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 11:22 AM

>>>>>To: Sparks, Stuart

>>>>> Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Johnson, Pat W

>>>>> Subject: Re: flashing truck warning on Dixie

>>>5>

>>>>> Stuart,

>>>>> 50 it would be the big signs with flashers at entrances to the zones from both directions similar to what "entering
a work zone" would be on the second option you mention? So south of CEMEX and north of LG&E? $4210?

>>>>>

>>>>> Sent from my iPad

>>>>

>>>>>>0n Oct 10, 2017, at 7:04 AM, Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

>5555>

>>>>>> CW Fowler,

>5555>

>>>>>> We have obtained a cost estimate for the truck warning sign flashers on Dixie Hwy at LG&E and CEMEX. The
cost for 48" LED truck warnings signs is $2,105 each. Currently, there are (4) truck warning signs. If you would like to
replace all of the existing signs the cost would be $8,420. Because the (2) zones are relatively close together, we could
only install flashers on the assembly entering each side of the zone. This cost will be $4,210. We will need your approval
and funding allocation before being able to move forward with the purchase of the signs. Please let me know if or which
of these options you are in favor of and we will work with KYTC to obtain the permit.

>2>>5>

>>>>>> Thanks,



Thieneman, Cindy L

o2 T STy
From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 4:00 PM
To: Thieneman, Cindy L
Cc: Fowler, Cindi
Subject: RE: Flashing LED Warning Lights on Dixie

Public Works will accept the funds for the enhanced signage.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Thieneman, Cindy L

Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2017 11:43 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc: Fowler, Cindi

Subject: Flashing LED Warning Lights on Dixie

Hello Mr. Brown,

Councilwoman Fowler will be paying for the costs of replacing the outside advance warning signs with LED Flashing
signs. This will be in the area of 15301 Dixje Highway. One at each end (for southbound traffic at LG&E and northbound
traffic at CEMEX). Will you please accept the CIF funds of $4,210.00 for the cost of the LED Flashing signs. Thank you

Cindy Thieneman | staff Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@louisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202




