Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
® Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Kramer, District 11

| Amount: $598.00 Date: October 25, 2017

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

To purchase and install a decorative Metro receptacle at 4037 Taylorsville Rd. In the public
rights-of-way. The manager of the business has agreed to empty trash receptacle.

City Agency: | MPWA - SWMS
Contact Person: ggith Hackett, Assistant Director of SWMS

Agency Phone: 574.0775

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

11 [+ ;/@%;,1 Q. /@w $598.00 10-25-2017
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
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Budget Revision #:
Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV;INTERA'GENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LMPWA - SWMS

Program/Project Name: 4037 Taylorsville Road Trash Receptacle
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA E
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA a
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes B
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000?7 If so, an ordinance is required. NA B
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No B
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes B

Date: 10-26-2017_

Submitted by: QH w m(mﬁ; \é\
C U

Revised May 2016



Harrington, Scott

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 12:36 PM
To: Hackett, Keith; Harrington, Scott

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Metro Lou Garbage Receptacle

The decorative receptacles are $598 each (new contract). The mounting locations are approved by Mr. Jeff Brown’s
engineers.

From: Hackett, Keith

Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 11:49 AM
To: Harrington, Scott

Cc: Fenster, Steve A; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Metro Lou Garbage Receptacle

Scott,
The permanent receptacles are $583.00 — this includes installation and a liner. Please contact Steve Fenster and he will

assist you in getting this placed.

Thanks
Keith Hackett

From: Harrington, Scott

Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2017 11:10 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc: Hackett, Keith

Subject: RE: Metro Lou Garbage Receptacle

Jeff - below is the request for a trash receptacle | was talking about.
Keith — I ran into Jeff on my floor and told him about this request so he said to send it to him.

One thing | forgot to mention... in the picture below the google map does not show the new sidewalk we just finished.

Thanks!

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Aide
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11



phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street

email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

Sign up for District 11’s E-Newsletter

Thank vou for the

From: Harrington, Scott

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2017 10:52 AM
To: Hackett, Keith

Cc: Harrington, Scott

Subject: Metro Lou Garbage Receptacle

RE: Ken Towery

4037 Taylorsville Rd.
409-8473

Keith,
The manager of Ken Towery request a Lou Metro Garbage Receptacle, one of the permanent ones with the City’s
logo. Currently, the manager has placed a plastic white tall basket that gets full quickly. Councilman Kramer noticed the

pile of trash during last Saturday’s Brightside Cleanup and spoke to the manager. He agreed to take responsibility of
empting the trash.

Would you please let me know how much a receptacle costs so CM Kramer can allocate funds to your department?
Thank you!

Scott
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Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Aide
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street
email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

"Sign up for District 11’s E-Newsletter

ity to serve!




