Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
| Primary Sponsor: James Peden |

| Amount: $46,000 Date: November 11, 2017 I

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding for the 2018 FridayFest concert series at Highview Park. This is a series of 6 shows held
throughout the spring and summer. All shows are free to attend and open to the public.

City Agency: Regina Tate
Contact Person: pjetro Parks

Agency Phone: 363-5591

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Department/Project:
Metro Parks & Recreation/FridayFest 2018

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.
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Interagency Name: Metro Parks

AGENCY CHECKLIST |

Program/Project Name: FridayFest 2018

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? No

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA ﬂ
" Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they ,

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
~ funding source is probably NDF. .

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA B

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
85,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. Yes ﬂ

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes

Submitted by:_( Yoy U5 /;/

Date: |I-227

Revised May 2016




Torsky, John N

From: Tate, Regina L

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 11:28 AM
To: Torsky, John N

Cc: Hallett, Michael A; Dumas, Tangela
Subject: RE: FridayFest Funds

John,

Metro Parks would be happy to receive the NDF funding for continuing FridayFest at Highview
Park. These funds will be used for expenses incurred in order for the neighborhood event to
continue. Please contact Tangela Dumas who is copied on this e-mail with all dates, and
information as far as your needs, efc.

Regards,

Regina Tate, CPRP
Events Coordinator
Louisville Metro Parks
Iroguois Amphitheater
502-363-5591

From: Dumas, Tangela

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 10:32 AM
To: Tate, Regina L

Cc: Hallett, Michael A

Subject: FW: FridayFest Funds

From: Torsky, John N

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 10:28 AM
To: Dumas, Tangela

Subject: FridayFest Funds

Ms. Dumas,

It’s time for us to start the process of moving NDF funds to Metro Parks for FridayFest 2018. We need an email from
Parks accepting these funds with a short description on how they will be used. This year the amount will be $46,000,
same as last year.

I've attached emails from 2014, 2015 and 2016 as an example for you. Let me know if you have any questions.
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Thank you,
John Torsky

John Torsky
Legislative Assistant
District 23 Metro Councilman James Peden

502-574-1123 - Office
502-574-3468 - Direct
502-574-4501 - Fax




Torsky, John N

From: Flood, Madonna

Sent: Monday, November 13, 2017 2:02 PM
To: Torsky, John N

Subject: Re: FridayFest

Yes and let me know what is needed
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 13, 2017, at 1:00 PM, Torsky, John N <john.Torsky@Iouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Councilwoman Flood,

It’s time for us to start planning FridayFest 2018 which means it’s time to start appropriating the funds
to Parks for the series. Are you guys planning on chipping in again, last you did $12,000.

Thanks,
John

John Torsky
Legislative Assistant
District 23 Metro Councilman James Peden

502-574-1123 - Office
502-574-3468 - Direct
502-574-4501 - Fax




Torsky, John N

From: Welch, Vicki A

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 11:41 AM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth

Cc: Torsky, John N; MetroCouncilClerk
Subject: Re: Friday Fest

Elizabeth may sign for me in order to get this in by Monday deadline.

Vicki Aubrey Welch

Councilwoman District 13

502-574-1113

Sent from my iPhone

Please disregard mistakes due to using iPhone. This account is confidential. If this email is sent to the
wrong entity by mistake, please notify sender & delete. Thank you!

On Nov 22, 2017, at 11:23 AM, Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

May | sign for you?

From: Torsky, John N

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 11:23 AM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth

Subject: FW: Friday Fest

From: Welch, Vicki A

Sent: Monday, November 13, 2017 1:31 PM
To: Torsky, John N

Cc: Alexander, Elizabeth; Flood, Madonna
Subject: Re: Friday Fest

Yes, | am happy to be part of this wonderful summer entertainment for our community for $6,000
once again!
Thanks!

Vicki Aubrey Welch

Councilwoman District 13
Louisville Metro Council
502-574-1113
vicki.welch@louisvilleky.gov
www.louisvilleky.gov/district13

From: Torsky, John N
Sent: Monday, November 13, 2017 1:01 PM
To: Welch, Vicki A




Cc: Alexander, Elizabeth
Subject: Friday Fest

Councilwoman Welch,

It's fime for us to start planning FridayFest 2018 which means it's time to start appropriating the
funds to Parks for the series. Are you planning on chipping in again, last you did $6,000.

Thanks,
John

John Torsky
Legislative Assistant
District 23 Metro Councilman James Peden

502-574-1123 - Office
502-574-3468 - Direct
502-574-4501 - Fax




