Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
u Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

o

| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $681.80

Date: January 4, 2018

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

PARC installation of thermal tape to mark parking t's in the 3200 block of Frankfort Avenue
between Crabbs Lane/Blackburn and S. Crestmoor Avenue on both sides of the street.

City Agency: Economic Growth & Innovation
Contact Person: Justin Robinson

Agency Phone: 502.574.3542

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9 WW $681.80

01/04/2018
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Request Amount:

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Amended Amount:

To OMB:

Account #:

To Project Manager:
Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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~ NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Economic Growth & Innovation

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDFrequest to a Metro Agenéy greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Parking T's along Frankfort Avenue (3200 block)

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

No

Yes

/R

Date: O ’O‘:H l/f

Revised May 2016




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Propes, Tiffany M

Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2018 9:13 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Wall, Shawn M

Subject: RE: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Good morning Kyle,

Hope you had a nice Christmas and New Year’s! Please see below - using thermal will last longer and hold up
better. We can lay this when the temperature is in the 40’s. If you choose to use paint, we will need to wait until spring
and the temperature has warmed up. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thanks!
Tiffany

hermal
Labor — $469.20
Material - $192.60
Propane -$20.00
Total - $681.80

Material - $76.16

Total - $545.86

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Wednesday, January 03, 2018 4:05 PM

To: Propes, Tiffany M

Subject: RE: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

Hi Tiffany,
Happy New Year!

Any updates on the cost estimate for parking £'s?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Counciliman Bili Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and

alerts!




From: Propes, Tiffany M

Sent: Monday, December 4, 2017 10:34 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: FW: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

Good morning Kyle,
I'll have the area reviewed. I'll follow up once they complete it.
Thanks!

From: Howell, Gerald

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 10:45 AM

To: Propes, Tiffany M; Wall, Shawn M

Cc: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: FW: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

On-street team —please see below

Gerald Howell

PARC - Parking Authority of River City
222 S. 1°t Street Ste # 400

{Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-3817

Fax: (502) 589-5114

https://louisvilleky.gov/government/parking-authority-parc

facebook twitter

Always take PRIDE in everything | do
ASSIST patrons to the best of my ability
Show RESPECT to all customers and fellow employees and
Provide top CUSTOMER SERVICE in a way that treats others the way | want to be treated

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 10:18 AM
To: Howell, Gerald; Perkins, Darryl

Subject: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

Good Morning, Gerald and Darryl.
In the past PARC has assisted us with marking parking t's along sections of Frankfort Avenue.

We would like to request an estimate and review of the 3200 block of Frankfort Avenue between Crabbs Lane/Blackburn
and S. Crestmoor Avenue on both sides of the street.

How many parking t's could be created and what would be the cost?
Thanks so much,

Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Fleischaker, Rebecca

Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2018 3:20 PM

To: Robinson, Justin A

Cc: Wall, Shawn M; Ethridge, Kyle; Propes, Tiffany M
Subject: RE: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

Yes, | approve of accepting and disbursing funds. ©

Thanks!

Rebecca Fleischaker

Deputy Director

Department of Economic Development
LOUISVILLE FORWARD

444 S, 5 Street, Suite 600

Louisville, KY 40202

502.574.2974
www.louisvilleky.gov/economicdevelopment

DEVELOPMENT

LOUISVILLE FORWARD

From: Robinson, Justin A

Sent: Thursday, January 4, 2018 3:18 PM

To: Fleischaker, Rebecca

Cc: Wall, Shawn M; Ethridge, Kyle; Propes, Tiffany M
Subject: RE: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue

Rebeccs,

Do you approve of accepting the funds mentioned below for parking T's along Frankfort Avenue? This request is
different than the one that Susan Hughes emailed us about earlier this month. Her funding was for parking T's along
Crittenden Drive and | have not seen the transfer documentation come through for that as of yet.

Thanks,

Justin

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, January 04, 2018 3:06 PM

To: Propes, Tiffany M

Cc: Wall, Shawn M; Robinson, Justin A

Subject: RE: New Parking T's on Frankfort Avenue




