Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
e Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin J. Kramer

| Amount: $15,000 Date: January 17, 2018

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding allocated to Public Works to pave Brookhollow Court, a metro owned road, in District 11.

City Agency: ouisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: patthew R. Haines, PE, Engineering Supervisor

Agency Phone: (502)574-3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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_NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Paving Brookhollow Court

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?
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Harrim_;ton, Scott i

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 10:37 AM
To: Harrington, Scott; Kramer, Kevin

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Brookhollow Dr

Scott,

Great news, we will add it to the paving list.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4™ Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Harrington, Scott

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 10:34 AM
To: Haines, Matthew R; Kramer, Kevin

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Brookhollow Dr

Matt -

Just to follow up with our phone conversation, Councilman Kramer will allocate $15,000 from District 11’s CIF to add
Brookhollow Court to this year’s paving schedule.

I'l work on filing the appropriations paperwork today.
Thank youl

Scott

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Aide
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street
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email: scott.harrington@Ilouisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

P2sion up for District 11's E-Newsletter

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 7:31 AM
To: Harrington, Scott

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Brookhollow Dr

Scott,

If Brookhollow Ct is paved the same time we pave Brookhollow Dr | estimate it will cost $15,000.00. If Brookhollow Ct is
paved as a separate project it will be $20,000.00.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5™ Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Harrington, Scott

Sent: Tuesday, January 16, 2018 5:04 PM
To: Haines, Matthew R

Subject: RE: Brookhollow Dr

Matt — how much would it cost to pave Brookhollow Ct?

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Aide
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street
email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

@ Sign up for District 11's E-Newsletter




From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Wednesday, January 10, 2018 12:16 PM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: Brookhollow Dr

Scott,

In reviewing Brookhollow Dr we have noticed that there are cul-de-sacs which maintain the Brookhollow Dr name for
address. We plan to pave these as part of the remainder of the road paving. | wanted to recommend that Beechlawn
Ct, Beechdale Ct, and Briarhollow Ct be added to this paving. | believe we can pave these 3 courts and stay within the
$157,000.00 budget or close to it. This will only leave Brookhollow Ct as the lone cul-de-sac not paved with this project
which is substantially longer than any of the other courts | have mentioned. | wanted to get your concurrence on doing
this prior as Brookhollw Dr is scheduled to be paid for with CIF bond and match dollars. If we go over budget, Public
works will cover the remainder.

Please let me know you agree and if anything needs to happen prior to starting this work.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)




