Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund {(NDF)
—Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Ch o vi 3. Fani [Fove |

[ Amount: % 447,69 Date: 4~ ¥~/ I

rDescription of program/project including public purpose, additional fundin sources,
g p g
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
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City Agency: O0¢6H'cC e o€ Susﬂ;wmb:'/:ﬂ—p‘ 7
Contact Person: Er; v T W2 MPS2

Agency Phone: =) 7 . ?ﬂ 20

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # CGuncil Member Signature Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returmned:
Revised May 2016
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| NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST =~

'Program/PrOJect Name: Tre,f'_ ‘}-Sw W 73 SW" f%{’;u? 9”

" 539 weslhesion

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?
‘Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this prOJect, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville |

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF,

Ordinance Requii'ed: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agénby greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporti'n'g"I)oct'l'ment'ation';" Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA |

Submitted by: é%ﬂ/bé /&5 _VWP{/»

Date: é’z 4 g/

Revised May 2016



Hamilton, Cheri

- R
From: Thompson, Erin
Sent: Friday, June 8, 2018 11:26 AM
To: Hamiiton, Cheri; Friend-Ellis, Myra
Cc: Wiedamann, Christopher
Subject: 4530 Westchester Ave Tree Removal Cost Estimate--SR#5037082
Attachments: BR_Costest_4530WestchesterAve_CD5_$240.00.pdf

As requested, attached is the cost estimate to remove the declining maple in the public row at 4530 Westchester Ave. If
council appropriates funds, the Division will accept them and schedule the work to be performed by the contractor. The
Division is unable to schedule the work prior to receiving funds.

Please let me know if there are any questions.
Thank you, Erin

Erin Thompson

Urban Forester/Community Forestry Supervisor

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A and ISA Tree Risk Assessment Qualified
Division of Community Forestry

Office of Sustainability-Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 6" floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4030
https://louisviileky.gov/government/division-community-forestry
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“No Job Too; Small, No Tree Too Tall”

www.bobrayco.com

Loy Mdro A, Erin Date .8.20108

Customer Name

P
Phiong ce £16-6768 _ Fax

Job Loeation 4930 Wostchester Az City Louisvitie State °Y Zip

Emait

Billing Address (H different)

-5 pecvﬁca‘m for Contract for) Estimatns -

Remove 105" declining Maple tree with stump.
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Hamilton, Cheri

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

CW Hamilton-

Thompsaon, Erin

Friday, June 8, 2018 2:32 PM

Hamilton, Cheri

Friend-Ellis, Myra; Wiedamann, Christopher
SR#5048013 721 Southwestern Pkwy

BR_CostEst_721 SouthwesternPkwy_CD5_$1200.00.pdf

Please find attached the cost estimate for the removal of two trees along the Varble side of the property at 721

southwestern Pkwy.

if council appropriates funds, the Division will accept them and schedule the work to be performed by the
contractor. The Division is unable to schedule the work prior to receiving funds.

Please let me know if there are any questions.

Thank you, Erin

Erin Thompson

Urban Forester/Community Forestry Supervisor
ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A and ISA Tree Risk Assessment Qualified

Division of Community Forestry

Office of Sustainability-Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 67 floor
Louisville, KY 40202
Office: (502) 574-4030

https://louisvilleky.gov/government/division-community-forestry
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“No Job Too Small, No Tree Too Tall”

www.bobrayco.com

Customer Name -0t Moo A Erin Date 6.8.2078
Phone Call 216-6768 Fax
Sab Location 31 Southrwastern Piovy, City LoVl State BV Zip

Bitiing Address (I differont) on file Email

-Spocifications for Contract {or) Sstimatos -

7). Remove 22.5 " Maple tree marked with X and stump.

$768.00

2). Remove 14" decayad Maple tree marked wilh pink dot €2 base with stump.
$432.00
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