Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
m Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: David Yates 1

| Amount: $194,500.00 Date: Jul 16, 2018 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Paving:  Nordic Drive from Stonestreet Road to Holiday Drive = $78,000.00 / Highcrest Avenue
from Nordic Drive to Dead End = $50,000.00 / 3rd Street Road Access from 9601 3rd Street Road
to 9619 3rd Street Road = $15,000.00 / Marseille Drive from Stonestreet to Dead End = $32,000 /
Jasper Drive from Marseille Drive to Dead End = $12,000 / Jasper Court from Jasper Drive to Dead
End = $7,500 Account Numbers: 8672-410-8106-048225-822702;
8676-410-8106-048225-822702; 8101-410-8199-148237-722702; 8101-410-8105-148377-822702;
8102-410-8105-148377-822702; 8672-410-8105-148377-822702; 8102-410-8105-148386-822703%

Print Form

]

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

25 ?/M $194,500.00 Jul 16, 2018

District # Council Membér Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Boles, Brian

From: Yates, David

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 2:15 PM
To: Boles, Brian

Subject: RE: CIF & MAP Signature
Brian,

Please sign the MAP request for $194,500.00 so it can be placed on the Appropriétions Committee agenda as soon as
possible.

Thank you,

David Yates

Councilman

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 3rd floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Email: david.yvates@louisvilleky.gov
Office: (502) 574-1125

Click HERE to sign up for the weekly District 25 eNews!

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use, disclosure,
distributing or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.

From: Yates, David

Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 9:56 AM

To: Boles, Brian <Brian.Boles@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CIF & MAP Signature

Brian,

Please sign both the CIF request for $234,500.00 and the MAP request for $143,000.00 so they can be placed on the
Appropriations Committee as soon as possible.

Thank you,

Dawvid Yates

District 25 Councilman
601 West Jefferson St, 3rd floor



NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works
Program/Project Name: Prairie Village Paving Project - MAP Funding Portion
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

. . Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Brian Boles Date: Jun 21, 2018

Revised May 2016



Boles, Brian

- |
From: Haines, Matthew R
Sent: Thursday, May 31, 2018 3:07 PM
To: Boles, Brian
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Yates, David
Subject: RE: District 25 Road Estimate Requests

See below in Red. This was a desktop review.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5" Street, 4'" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) I 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Boles, Brian

Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 8:21 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E; Yates, David

Subject: Re: District 25 Road Estimate Requests

The sooner the better, but hopefully by the end of next week. | understand you have lots on your plate so whenever you
can get to it so we can put it in the ordinance.

Thank you,

Brian Boles

Legislative Assistant
Councilman David Yates

District 25

601 West Jefferson St, 3rd Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

On May 25, 2018, at 7:57 AM, Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Brian,

What is the date you need to have these estimates back by for consideration to add to the budget
ordinance? |am hoping | can perform a desktop review today on these roads but If | see something on
google maps which requires a field visit, it may be late next week or early the following week before |
can provide all estimates.

Thanks,
Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor
Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets



444 South 5% Street, 4*" Floor
Louisville KY 40202
502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1502 574 4129 (F)

From: Boles, Brian

Sent: Thursday, May 24, 2018 6:29 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E; Haines, Matthew R
Cc: Yates, David

Subject: District 25 Road Estimate Requests
Importance: High

Jeff & Matthew,

| know these are a lot of roads, but i believe David intends to complete as many as possible in the Prairie
Village area as possible with leftover CIF dollars. After speaking with David we are requesting estimates
for the following roads:

fkl. Nordic Drive From Stonestreet Rd to Holiday Dr $78,000.00
~=k2. Highcrest Avenue from Nordic Dr to dead end $50,000.00 (from Holiday to Nordic appears to
have been paved previously)
3. Vega Lane from Holiday Dr to the dead end $62,500.00

These two Streets were not paved by the State a few years back when 3™ Street Road was paved. We
were told the state would not pave these access streets and that they were Louisville Metro
Responsibilities.
| see on Lojic that information has been updated and it is Metro’s responsibility.
¥ 4. 37 Street Road Access Road — 9601 — 9619 $15,000.00

5. 3" Street Road Access Road — 9711 — 9731 $20,000.00

Gaywood Drive From Stonestrret Rd to Nanka Rd $45,000.00
Nanka Road from dead end to Iron Horse Way $150,000.00
Moonlight Way from Valley Station Rd to Heavenly Way $80,000.00
Starlight Way from Moonlight Way to Moonlight Way $85,000.00
10. Crestridge Drive from Gaywood Dr to Nanka Rd $35,000.00

11. Prairie Drive from Stonestreet Rd to Nanka Rd $72,000.00

LN

- 12. Marseille Drive from Stonestreet Rd to dead end $32,000.00
E& Jasper Drive from Marseille Dr to dead end $12,000.00
4. Jasper Court from Jasper Dr to dead end $7,500.00

15. Bridgegate Court from Holiday Dr to dead end $25,000.00
16. Fordhaven Road from St Anthony Church Rd to dead end $110,000.00

17. Springfield Drive from St Anthony Church Rd to St Anthony Gardens Dr $70,000.00
18. Mitchell Lane from 3™ Street Rd to dead end (note: includes Docks Ln as well) $100,000.00

Thank you,
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