Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |

| Amount: $5,000 Date: July 2, 2018 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Parks for the shade structure in Breslin Park.

City Agency: Metro Parks
Contact Person: Jason Canuel

Agency Phone: 574-6086

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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- Program/Project Name:

' Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description?

‘Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
-~ the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
 disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
- funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

| Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Skate Spot and shade structure in Breslin Park

Yes/No/NA
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NA

NA

Yes

Yes

No

No

Yes
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Canuel, Jason T

Sent: Friday, June 29, 2018 4:32 PM

To: Westenhofer, Mary Ann; Ethridge, Kyle; Brooke Pardue
Cc: Veeneman, Andrea R,

Subject: RE: Update on Breslin

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

I think we have come up with a plan for Parks to expend the funds.
So, yes, Parks will gladly accept the funding for the Breslin Park skate spot.

Jason T. Canuel

Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
PO Box 37280

Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502/574.6086 (office)
502/439.7694 (cell)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov

From: Westenhofer, Mary Ann

Sent: Friday, June 29, 2018 4:30 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Brooke Pardue; Canuel, Jason T
Cc: Veeneman, Andrea R.

Subject: RE: Update on Breslin

Kyle, they had a meeting this afternoon. I’'m sure Brooke or Jason will get in touch with you shortly.

Mary Ann Westenhofer, CPRP
Assistant Director

Louisville Parks and Recreation
Telephone: (502) 574-6118

Fax: (502) 456-3269
http:/ /www.louisvillekv.gov/MetroParks/

From: Ethridge, Kyle
Sent: Friday, June 29, 2018 4:23 PM




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Brooke Pardue <bpardue@Iouisvilleparksfoundation.org>
Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 4:45 PM

To: Hollander, Bill H,; Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Leslie McNulty

Subject: Update on Breslin

Attachments: Proposed Concept Renderings.pdf; Shade Structure 2.jpg
Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Bill and Kyle —

Attached are the most recent renderings for the skate spot, and the shade structure. | am having Hunger
incorporate the shade structure in their renderings, for fundraising purposes, but we plan to locate it on the
Payne Street side of the bathrooms, where anyone sitting there can see the swings, sprayground, playground
and skate spot, and where it will be visible from Payne Street, as another cool addition to the park.

We are still working on how the skate spot will incorporate with the walking path, but are not crazy about this
latest iteration, so don’t pay any attention to that. You will see a bright green object now...it"s a shamrock, as
a shout out to Irish Hill! :0)

We hope to have a final fundraising packet together by next week and will share when we do. So far, we have
not been ready for any introductions, so no worries there, but will let you know when we need the cyber-intro
to Kelly Lawrence, Kentucky Financial Group and Headliners.

We are using the following language in the documents and are creating a “logo” for the project.

Breslin Park 2.0
The Louisville Parks Foundation is taking Breslin Park up a notch! With the addition of the Midwest’s First Skate
Spot, and a super-cool Shade Structure, Breslin Park is getting a fabulous new upgrade.”

Just wanted to keep you in the loop. Let me know if you need anything else from me before you can make a
determination about what you can contribute to the project. The total cost is now $106,000 including the
shade structure. There may be some additional costs, based on the final plan to reroute those two sections of
the walking path.

Thanks! Brooke

Brooke Pardue
President/CEQ

Louigvilie Parks Foundation
2.0, Box 5755

Lotisviile, Y 0255

(502} 214-3690

Ipfky.org




