Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Barbara Sexton Smith ]

| Amount: $1794 Date: 07-02-2018 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): ~,rne

Request for placement of decorative trash cans to be placed at the s@tof 18th and Cedar
Street- Russell Neighborhood

2- south end of the building on Logan & St Catherine corner and then one across the street from

on the southeast corner of Logan Street Market parking lot - Shelby Park ~N \a;,-gg\ ber hoodd

City Agency: Solid Waste Managment
Contact Person: Kimberly Sullivan

Agency Phone: 574-2781

I'have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # ] Council Member Sig?rﬁ e Amount Date
/ e

L Print Form j

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Solid Waste Management

Program/Project Name: 3 decorative trash recpetacles 1 in Russell 2 in Shelby Park
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
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: : Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Christa Robinson Date: 7-2-18

Revised May 2016



Robinson, Christa
m

From: Sarah Height <sarah@safaicoffee.com>
Sent: Friday, June 1, 2018 2:21 PM

To: Robinson, Christa

Subject: Trash Cans Follow-Up

Hello Christa!

Barbara was so great at our Groundbreaking Ceremony. She is just the best speaker!

I know we were in a discussion about the 2 trash cans Barbara will be providing for in front of the Logan Street Market
and | wanted to follow-up on that. | am still waiting to hear back from Aida Copic from TARC about their final decision
on the covered busstop but it appears that whichever option they go with will come with a trash can.

So. Let’s move ahead for one on the south end of the building on Logan & St Catherine corner and then one across the
street from us on the southeast corner of our parking lot.

Please let me know anything that | need to do to move forward!

Thanks a miilion!

Sarah Height

Director, Logan Street Market
502-919-0549
sarah@safaicoffee.com




Robinson, Christa
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From: Sullivan, Kimberly L

Sent: Tuesday, June 19, 2018 5:59 PM

To: Robinson, Christa; Booker, Richmond

Subject: RE: Questions about the cost of a permanent trash can

$598

Kimberly Sullivan

Louisville Metro Public Works
Solid Waste Management (SWMS)
(502) 574-2781

From: Booker, Richmond

Sent: Tuesday, June 19, 2018 5:12:44 PM
To: Robinson, Christa; Sullivan, Kimberly L
Subject: RE: Questions about the cost of a permanent trash can

Ms. Sullivan,
Will you give here the cost please.

Sent from my Verizon 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Robinson, Christa" <Christa.Robinson@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Date: 6/19/18 4:59 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Booker, Richmond" <Richmond.Booker@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Questions about the cost of a permanent trash can
Hello sir,

What is the cost of a permanent trash can to be placed at 18" and cedar at the bus stop. People keep dumping the trash
in the yard and stealing the wire resecptacles.

Christa Robinson
Legislative Assistant
Metro Council District Four

Councilwoman Barbara Sexton Smith



