Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

l Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler

|

qr .|
| Amount: <& & N0 . — Date: July 9, 2018

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Request to maintain 2 Brighsites at Southern parkway and |-264 and Southern Parkway at
Southern Heights.

City Agency: Louisville Forward
Contact Person: Gina O'Brien

Agency Phone: 502-574-6256

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have

determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
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Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016

Page |




Department/Project:
Brightsites Southern Parkway

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Louisville Forward

Program/Project Name: Brightsites Southern Parkway

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If VCIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: shughes Date: Jul9, 2018

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

=
From: OBrien, Gina |.
Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 4:20 PM
To: Wiederwohl, Mary Ellen; Butler, Marianne
Cc Hughes, Susan
Subject: RE: Brightsites - need your advice

This is fantastic thank you so much Councilwoman Butler!

I will be happy to accept the $4,000 in funding to maintain both sites at Southern Parkway and 1-264 and Southern
Parkway at Southern Heights. Please let me know if this email is sufficient or if you would like a separate email.

Thank you kindly, | am grateful!
Gina Iorio O'Brien

From: Wiederwohl, Mary Ellen

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 2:21 PM

To: Butler, Marianne; OBrien, Gina I.

Cc: Hughes, Susan

Subject: Re: Brightsites - need your advice

Awesome! This was easier than I thought.

Gina - see below. We hav'e aplan! And Marianne needs a thank you sign with wings and a halo, please.
I'll follow up with MCD 2 and 10 separately.

Thanks all!

Mary Ellen Wiederwohl
Chief, Louisville Forward

On Jul 6, 2018, at 2:02 PM, Butler, Marianne <Marianne.Butler@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

[ can do Southern Parkway and will ask d21 to split the cost.
Contact Pat and Barbara Shanklin about Poplar Level.

Just need an e-mail from Brightside saying they will accept the funds for the two sites and we
can transfer the money.

Marianne

From: Wiederwohl, Mary Ellen

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 1:54:53 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: Brightsites - need your advice



Gina O’Brien and I were catching up this week, and she let me know that she has three
older sites that are in jeopardy because they no longer have any maintenance

funding. They've been without an active sponsor for at least the past five years. If we can't
find a sponsor, we'll have to let them go.

The three sites are below; the first two are very close to one another and almost look like
one site, then the third stands alone. Brightside spends $8,000 annually to collectively
maintain the sites; the annual costs per site are noted:

1, Southern Parkway and I-264 = $2,000

2. Southern Parkway at Southern Heights = $2,000

3. Poplar Level Road at I-264 = $4,000

Michelle Black White (Brightside “super” board member) met with Lauren DePaso at
Churchill Downs in the summer of 2017 about them potentially taking over the Southern
Parkway site. And Brightside also tried to engage Matt Bissell with Churchill Downs to work
out an in-kind maintenance exchange in the Fall of 2017. Neither one of those asks were
successful.

I have NOT asked Kevin Flanery. I wanted to get your advice/thoughts on whether we
should approach CD together about the Southern Pkwy sites? Whether you have other
ideas? And do you want me to reach out to Pat M directly on the Poplar Level site?

Would love to know what you think!
Thanks!

Mary Ellen Wiederwohl

Chief, Louisville Forward

444 South Fifth Street, 6" Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-5768

Marvellen.wiederwohl@louisvilleky.gov

www.louisvilleky.gov/louisvilleforward




Hughes, Susan

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 2:34 PM

To: Lanshima, Vitalis

Cc: Morgan, Briana; Hughes, Susan
Subject: Fw: Brightsites - need your advice

Vitalis — I am offering to cover the Southern Parkway exits of the watterson — will you split with me? $2000
a piece?

Thanks - Marianne

From: Wiederwohl, Mary Ellen

Sent: Friday, July 6, 2018 1:54:53 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: Brightsites - need your advice

Gina O'Brien and I were catching up this week, and she let me know that she has three older sites that
are in jeopardy because they no longer have any maintenance funding. They’ve been without an active
sponsor for at least the past five years. If we can'’t find a sponsor, we’'ll have to let them go.

The three sites are below; the first two are very close to one another and almost look like one site, then
the third stands alone. Brightside spends $8,000 annually to collectively maintain the sites; the annual
costs per site are noted:

1. Southern Parkway and I-264 = $2,000

2. Southern Parkway at Southern Heights = $2,000

3. Poplar Level Road at I-264 = $4,000

Michelle Black White (Brightside “super” board member) met with Lauren DePaso at Churchill Downs in
the summer of 2017 about them potentially taking over the Southern Parkway site. And Brightside also
tried to engage Matt Bissell with Churchill Downs to work out an in-kind maintenance exchange in the Fall
of 2017. Neither one of those asks were successful.

I have NOT asked Kevin Flanery. I wanted to get your advice/thoughts on whether we should approach
CD together about the Southern Pkwy sites? Whether you have other ideas? And do you want me to
reach out to Pat M directly on the Poplar Level site?

Would love to know what you think!
Thanks!

Mary Ellen Wiederwohl

Chief, Louisville Forward

444 South Fifth Street, 6™ Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-5768

Maryellen.wiederwohl@louisvilleky.gov

www.louisvilleky.gov/louisvilleforward




