Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
¢ Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)

| Primary Sponsor: G-len Stuclcel

| Amount: # (5 763, 20 Date: 9 [20 /13

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Stdewalk (‘Q‘-v;\'u‘(' at 3o + 311> [ake Vista Dr,
as well as +we locations gcross Gomn 4775
Shenan doch Deive,

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: (4 | 4 Allen

Agency Phone: St _ ¢, 1 59

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

[7 Clon St=Lok @& *15704,*° q/21l¢

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Print Form

|

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount;
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
Page 1



Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name: S idevvallc vep air

. Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) ; -
Appropriating Funding? P Y
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? N § /A
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ‘
the request exclude the matching fund amount? VY A

i N
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they ; .
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? |- N / A

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville !
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the j
funding source is probably NDF. \[

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful \
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ’ - Y

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than -
- $5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. B / A

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? o
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - N / /.\

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid o
estimate and description of cost? - )'/

Submitted by: 46;) E@ﬁd%/v% Date: CZ/L@ /l o]

Revised May 2016



Eatherly, Kip

Lo RGO
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 1:15 PM
To: Eatherly, Kip
Subject: Sidewalk Repairs
Kip,

It looks like I'm not going to need any additional funding after all for the sidewalk repairs that are currently under way.

Please see the recently requested estimates below for your appropriations paper work if Councilman Stuckel is able to
fund these repairs. Please let me know as soon as you know Councilman Stuckel’s plans.

LOCATION 3110 & 3113 Lake Vista Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 17
RATE 5
DATE SENT 9/19/2018
ESTIMATE BY CA
3110: 4'x9' of sw, s/p; 3113:18'x4' of
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS sw, 15" tree
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $4,951.10
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

LOCATION Across the road from 4775 Shenandoah Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 17
RATE Sand4
DATE SENT 9/19/2018
ESTIMATE BY CA
28'x4" and 21'x4' of sw, 38" and 18"
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS trees, s/p
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $10,817.10
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.
Thank you,

Craig Allen, E.L.T.

Engineer|

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5% Street, 4*" Floor
Louisville KY 40202

(502)574-6159



Helton, Jessamyn

e —= S neae
From: Eatherly, Kip
Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 4:30 PM
To: Helton, Jessamyn
Subject: FW: sidewalks

Will this work?

Kip Eatherly | Legislative Assistant

Office of District 17 Councilman Glen Stuckel
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
502-574-3462

From: Glen Stuckel <gestuckel@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 4:25 PM

To: Eatherly, Kip <Kip.Eatherly@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: sidewalks

Yes, you have my permission to sign the paperwork for me

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 20, 2018, at 3:56 PM, Eatherly, Kip <Kip.Eatherly@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Is it OK if | sign the paperwork on your behalf?

Kip Eatherly | Legislative Assistant

Office of District 17 Councilman Glen Stuckel
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
502-574-3462

From: Glen Stuckel <gestuckel@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 3:04 PM
To: Eatherly, Kip <Kip.Eatherly@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: sidewalks

Yes, please proceed.

On Thu, Sep 20, 2018 at 1:25 PM Eatherly, Kip <Kip.Eatherly@Ilouisvilleky.gov> wrote:

You might recall there are 20+ sidewalk repairs underway in the district. We have received requests
from two different folks regarding a total of four other sections in need of repair that are, as luck would
have it, on the same streets as some of the ongoing projects. The thought, then, was it makes sense to
squeeze those four in with the current work if we can. Craig Allen with PW sent the email below
outlining the cost. Just to confirm, are you OK with going ahead and funding the four sidewalk repairs
outlined below? The grand total would be $15,768.20.



Kip,

It looks like I’'m not going to need any additional funding after all for the sidewalk repairs that are
currently under way.

Please see the recently requested estimates below for your appropriations paper work if Councilman
Stuckel is able to fund these repairs. Please let me know as soon as you know Councilman Stuckel’s
plans.

LOCATION 3110 & 3113 Lake Vista Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 17
RATE 5
DATE SENT 9/19/2018
ESTIMATE BY CA
3110: 4'x9' of sw, s/p; 3113: 18'x4' of
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS sw, 15" tree
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $4,951.10
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

LOCATION Across the road from 4775 Shenandoah Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 17
RATE 5and 4
DATE SENT 9/19/2018
ESTIMATE BY CA
28'x4" and 21'x4' of sw, 38" and 18"
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS trees, s/p
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $10,817.10
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

Kip Eatherly | Legislative Assistant



Office of District 17 Councilman Glen Stuckel
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202

502-574-3462

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely
for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are
hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of
this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.





