&
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request @
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler ]

| Amount: $997.40 . Date: October 30, 2018 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding will be used for printing teen drug cards for youth to help those struggling with drug
issues.

City Agency: Resilience and (Eommun‘i'ty ?erv?ce
Contact Person: Jacqueline Johnson

Agency Phone: 502-313-4089

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

15 /D M%Jﬁx $997.40 Oct 30, 2018

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amouﬁt: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: _. Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Resilience and Community Services

Program/Project Name: Teen Drug Cards
> ki iaihinen B S ~ i Ve NoNA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) ' -

Appropriating Funding? Yes
‘Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? No

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
funding source is probably NDF.

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: Oct30, 2018

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

From: Johnson, Jacqueline B

Sent: Thursday, October 25, 2018 11:57 AM

To: Butler, Marianne; Hughes, Susan; Luckett, Daniel R
Subject: FW: Invoice for South Central Neighborhood Place
Attachments: Invoice_37623-1.pdf; ATT00001.htm

Good morning,

Attached you will find an invoice for the Drug Awareness cards for youth. We are willing to accept your payment for
printing from your office.

Thank you!
Jackie

From: Katie Kone <kkone@famchildplace.org>

Sent: Thursday, October 25, 2018 9:45 AM

To: Johnson, Jacqueline B <Jacqueline.Johnson@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for South Central Neighborhood Place

FINALLY!

From: NANCY HARTLAGE [mailto:nancy@farleyprintco.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 25, 2018 9:46 AM

To: Katie Kone

Subject: Invoice for South Central Neighborhood Place

Notice of Confidentiality: This e-mail, including any attachments, is intended only for the use of the individual or entity
to which it is addressed and may contain confidential information that is legally privileged and exempt from disclosure
under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are notified that any review, use,
disclosure, distributing, or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication
in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy (delete) all forms of the original message.



FARLEY

PRINTING

Farley Printing Co. Inc.

1014 South Sixth St. 7 2
Louisville, Ky. 40203 3 6 3
Ph: (502) 587-3055

Fax: (502) 587-3052

customerservice@farleyprintco.com
Date: 10/2518

Customer PQ:

Jackie Johnson
South Central Neighborhood Place

Quantity | B DescTiDtion Chea s A S R S S A un
7,400 Fliers (total order 10,000 - b||| spllt) 4.75 x 14 80# COUGAR COVER, prlnted 4 colors $ 997.40
front 4 colors back
Taken by: Nancy SUBTOTAL $997.40
SHIPPING
TOTAL $997.40
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Hughes, Susan

From: Butler, Marianne ﬂw}
Sent: Friday, September 21, 2018 3:00 PM ~

To: Johnson, Jacqueline B —

Cc: Hughes, Susan; Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: Re: Teen Drug Cards

Hi Jackie - happy to help with funding - you need to get a couple of quotes. When you know the one you want to use e-
mail me with the quote and state that your department is willing to accept the money for payment. We will then start
an interagency transfer. Know that it will take about a mo th to get the money in your account.

So glad the teens are pro active! Marianne

From: Johnson, Jacqueline B

Sent: Friday, September 21, 2018 1:45:19 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: Teen Drug Cards

Hi Marianne,

I hope you are doing well. The South Central Neighborhood Place Community Council and
PAL Coalition youth are in the final stages of developing a teen drug card made for teens and
created by teens. The goal is to give them out to teens so they can give them out to other teens
who are struggling with drugs or have loved ones struggling with drugs. We want to roll it out
at the Wahlberg Foundation Drug Summit in October and also at Iroquois, with hopes of
reaching as many high schools as we can.

We are looking for funding to help with printing and are wondering if you all have any ability
to help us or know of others who can. The media contact at Family and Children’s Place is
working on polishing it up and coming up with another option for design. Then we’ll take it to
the youth and the Council for final adjustments. We are very excited about the work the teens
have put into creating this!

I would love to talk more with you about ideas for funding. Let me know your thoughts.
I look forward to hearing from you.

Jacqueline B. Johnson, MSSW

Administrator

South Central Neighborhood Place

Louisville Metro Office of Resilience and Community Services
4255 Hazelwood Avenue

Louisville, KY 40215

Phone: 502-313-4089 Fax: 502-574-4556

Email: Jacqueline.Johnson@louisvilleky.gov
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