From: Hurt, Ellen

To: Helton, Jessamyn
Cc: McQuillen, Liz; Blackwell, Rick; Lanshima, Vitalis
Subject: Re: Tree Removal and Replacement Appropriation
Date: Thursday, November 29, 2018 9:46:40 AM
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Thank you so much! We will just use the previously past item and amend that if that's ok with
you all.

Thanks again for your help--we are so grateful!
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 29, 2018, at 9:42 AM, Helton, Jessamyn <Jessamyn.Helton@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

| will add the previous item for reconsideration.

Jess Helton

Deputy Clerk

Louisville Metro Council

601 West Jefferson Street, 1st Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

Phone - 502-574-2704

Fax - 502-574-3363

Email -jessamyn.helton@Iouisvilleky.gov

From: McQuillen, Liz

Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2018 9:41 AM

To: Hurt, Ellen <Ellen.Hurt@louisvilleky.gov>; Blackwell, Rick
<Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lanshima, Vitalis <Vitalis.Lanshima@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Helton, Jessamyn
<Jessamyn.Helton@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Tree Removal and Replacement Appropriation

Good Morning Ellen —

Councilman Blackwell approves adding this onto the Appropriations agenda for next
week. Will the previously passed item for the removal needed to be reconsidered to
add funding for the replacement? Or will this be a separate item?

Thanks,
Liz McQuillen
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Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell
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(502) 574-1112 f: (502) 574-3363
www.RickBlackwell.com

From: Hurt, Ellen
Sent: Wednesday, November 28, 2018 4:59 PM
To: Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lanshima, Vitalis <Vitalis.Lanshima@Iouisvilleky.gov>; McQuillen, Liz
<Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov>; Helton, Jessamyn

<Jessamyn.Helton@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Tree Removal and Replacement Appropriation

Dear Councilman Blackwell,

As you may remember, Councilman Lanshima had an appropriation on the agenda at
the last meeting to remove some trees on East Esplanade
(https://louisville.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=6715203&GUID=F888927F-CAQ5-
40E9-A8AB-D179DEACF1DEF). There was some discussion regarding the replacement of
the trees and Councilman Lanshima did want to include that cost in this project. |
checked with Erin Thompson on the cost for replacing the trees and she did not include
that in the cost for this appropriation (see below email). Councilman Lanshima would
like to add that to this appropriation if possible and would like to request that it get on

the next Appropriations Committee agenda coming up on December 5™ 5o that he can
make that amendment. If that is agreeable to you, we would certainly appreciate it.

Thank you so much for your consideration and assistance with this. We truly appreciate
it.
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Ellen Hurt

District 21 Legislative Assistant
Councilman Vitalis Lanshima
601 W Jefferson Street

Office: 502-574-1121

Cell: 502-797-3257

From: Thompson, Erin

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2018 11:14 AM

To: Hurt, Ellen

Subject: RE: Tree Removal Cost Estimates for Esplanade (200, 203, and 204)

Ellen-


http://cp.mcafee.com/d/5fHCMUSyMM-Yeooh76XCShPXNEVsLsSOevud7bz5Pr8VZUQsKnjdzAQkQPhOYqejpYxjyLMxW1o57RrBgP8Y_OFrydj9I-HsG6p7D-lbshGpdTtRzQT7-LOrRSrEZuVtdBB7DbFFKeth5dqWqJS7el3PWApmU6CQjr9K_9LK8Ind7bRQPtPo085OIl6jZIlcuuvOVKto5JUz6JamQY_iuM1hZmVkcOffZmy700joVdZdwS2NF8Qge8ETd40OvJyFEw1cLd40BlKcPh0ndFK6R7Qnhm9s
mailto:Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Vitalis.Lanshima@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Liz.McQuillen@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Jessamyn.Helton@louisvilleky.gov
https://louisville.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=6715203&GUID=F888927F-CA05-40E9-A8AB-D179DEACF1DF
https://louisville.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=6715203&GUID=F888927F-CA05-40E9-A8AB-D179DEACF1DF

No, the cost was only for the tree removal work. It was my understanding that CD21
was to have the property owners replace the trees. The cost for a 1.5” caliper tree for
replacement with contractor installation is $312.00. The extra cost for a water bag is
$15.00 but not a requirement for the replacement. Also, a root barrier is not needed
to be installed because the green verge is greater that 6 feet in width.

If CD21 will fund the replacements, the costs will change to:

Address Tree Removal Tree Replacement Total Cost
200 E Esplanade $1920.00 S 312.00 $2,232.00
Ave
203 E Esplanade $1920.00 S 312.00 $2,232.00
Ave
204 E Esplanade S 768.00 S 312.00 $1,080.00
Ave

If the replacement cost is not fully spent, the remainder will be returned to council.
Please let me know how you wish to proceed.
Thank you, Erin

Erin Thompson

Urban Forester/Community Forestry Supervisor

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A and ISA Tree Risk Assessment Qualified
Division of Community Forestry

Office of Sustainability-Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 6t floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4030
https://louisvilleky.gov/government/division-community-forestry
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From: Hurt, Ellen

Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 5:21 PM

To: Thompson, Erin <Erin.Thompson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Tree Removal Cost Estimates for Esplanade (200, 203, and 204)

Hi Erin,
This was going through appropriations tonight and the question came up about

replacing these trees. Does your cost estimate include replacing the trees or will that
be extra?


https://louisvilleky.gov/government/division-community-forestry
https://twitter.com/SustainLou
https://www.facebook.com/Sustain-Louisville-371596559605367/
mailto:Erin.Thompson@louisvilleky.gov

Thanks for your help,
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Ellen Hurt

District 21 Legislative Assistant
Councilman Vitalis Lanshima
601 W Jefferson Street

Office: 502-574-1121

Cell: 502-797-3257

From: Thompson, Erin

Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 6:40 PM

To: Hurt, Ellen

Subject: RE: Tree Removal Cost Estimates for Esplanade (200, 203, and 204)

Happy to help! Erin

From: Hurt, Ellen

Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 6:39 PM

To: Thompson, Erin <Erin.Thompson@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Morgan, Briana <Briana.Morgan@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Wiedamann, Christopher
<Christopher.Wiedamann®@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Lanshima, Vitalis
<Vitalis.Lanshima@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Tree Removal Cost Estimates for Esplanade (200, 203, and 204)

Thanks you! We will get the funding transferred in the coming weeks. We really
appreciate your help.

Thanks again!
Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 18, 2018, at 6:37 PM, Thompson, Erin <Erin.Thompson@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
wrote:

Hello Ellen-

Attached is the requested cost estimates from the city contractor for the
removal of the public right of way trees at 200, 203, and 204 E Esplanade
Ave.
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If Council District 21 appropriates funds for the specified work, the
Division will accept the funds and have the contractor perform the work.
The Division is not able to have the work performed prior to receiving the
appropriated funds. Be advised, cost estimates are only valid for a limited
time period. Before submitting to Appropriations Committee for
approval, if there has been a time lapse greater than 60 days since the
date of the cost estimate, please contact me to determine if the cost
estimate needs to be revised.

Please let me know how else | may assist you.
Thank you, Erin

Erin Thompson

Urban Forester/Community Forestry Supervisor

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A and ISA Tree Risk Assessment Qualified
Division of Community Forestry

Office of Sustainability-Louisville Metro Government

527 W. Jefferson Street, 61" floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4030
https://louisvilleky.gov/government/division-community-forestr
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<BR_CE_200 Esplanade_$1920.00.pdf>
<BR_CE_203 Esplanade_$1920.00.pdf>
<BR_CE_204 Esplanade_$768.00.pdf>
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