Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Vicki Welch |

| Amount: $7375.27 Date: Nov 30, 2018 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
APPROPRIATING $4,500 FROM DISTRICT 13 CAPITAL
INFRASTRUCTURE FUNDS TO PUBLIC WORKS FOR TWO SPEED

HUMPS AND TWO SPEED HUMP SIGNS TO BE PLACED AT CANDLELIGHT LANE BETWEEN
NEW CUT ROAD AND GLIMMER WAY; AND APPROPRIATING $2875.27 FROM CAPITAL
INFRASTRUCTURE FUNDS FOR SIDEWALK REPAIRS AT 209 & 211 HARPERS FERRY RD

Clty Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Greg Dow 574-3882 and Craig Allen 574-6159

Agency Phone: 574-3882 and 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works
Program/Project Name: CIF from Council District 13 for Speed Humps and Sidewalk repairs
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

- ; Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes
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GREG FISCHER
MAYOR

TO:

FROM:

DATE:

RE:

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY

VANESSA D. BURNS

Director

Councilwoman Vicki Welch
District 13

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

November 5, 2018
Cost of Speed Humps for Candlelight Lane

Two (2) Speed Humps x $2,050.00 =  $4,100.00
Two (2) Speed Hump Signs x $200.00 $400.00
Total= $4,500.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,050.00 and each sign is $200.00. Based on our
Engineering Studies, a total of two (2) speed humps and two (2) speed hump signs have been proposed
for Candlelight Lane, between New Cut Road and Glimmer Way. The total “not to exceed” cost is

$4,500.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW.LOUISVILLEKY.GOV

METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH 5™ STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202
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Alexander, Elizabeth

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Yes you may sign

Vicki Aubrey Welch
Councilwoman District 13
502-574-1113

Sent from my iPhone

Welch, Vicki A

Friday, November 30, 2018 12:01 PM
Alexander, Elizabeth

Nichols, Barbara J

Re: signature permission

Please disregard mistakes due to using iPhone. This account is confidential. If this email is sent to the
wrong entity by mistake, please notify sender & delete. Thank you!

On Nov 30, 2018, at 11:55 AM, Alexander, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Alexander@louisvilleky.govs> wrote:

From: Alexander, Elizabeth

Sent: Friday, November 30, 2018 11:45 AM

To: Welch, Vicki A <Vicki.Welch@louisvilleky.gov> _

Cc: Nichols, Barbara J (Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky.gov) <Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: signature permission

Please allow me to sign for the amended CIF for $7375.27 for speed humps in Candlelight and sidewalk
repairs on Harpers Ferry for Public Works. Thanks

<image003.png>Elizabeth Alexander Legislative Aide
Office of Councilwoman Vicki Aubrey Welch
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1113

(502) 574-4422

www.louisvilleky.gov/district13




Alexander, Elizabeth

— — ErnEes
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 4:13 PM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth
Cc: Welch, Vicki A; Nichols, Barbara J; MetroCall
Subject: RE: Sidewalk at 209 &211 Harpers Ferry Road

Elizabeth,

Please see the below estimate for the sidewalk repairs at 209 & 211 Harpers Ferry Rd. If you have any questions please
let me know.

LOCATION 209 & 211 Harpers Ferry Rd
REQUESTED BY Dist 13

RATE 5

DATE SENT 11/27/2018
ESTIMATE BY CA

29 square yards of sidewalk and

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS driveway, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,875.27
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.
Thanks,

Craig Allen, E.L.T.

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
(502) 574 6159

From: Alexander, Elizabeth

Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 9:58 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Welch, Vicki A <Vicki.Welch@louisvilleky.gov>; Nichols, Barbara J <Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky.gov>; MetroCall
<Metro.Call@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Sidewalk at 209 &211 Harpers Ferry Road

Hi Craig,
Please see attached photos of the sidewalk located in front of 209& 211 Harpers Ferry Rd. Ms. Cecilia May who resides
at 209 Harpers Ferry Rd tripped and fell on the sidewalk in front of her house; suffered some bumps and bruises. Was

hoping something could be done to repair them since there is work going on across the street. Would you please take a
look and give us an estimate? THANKS



Alexander, Elizabeth

==
From: Allen, Craig L
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 10:19 AM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth
Cc: Welch, Vicki A; Nichols, Barbara J; MetroCall
Subject: RE: Sidewalk at 209 &211 Harpers Ferry Road
Hi Elizabeth,

I'm going to take a look at it this morning. | should be able to give you an estimate this afternoon.

Thanks,
Craig

From: Alexander, Elizabeth

Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 9:58 AM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Welch, Vicki A <Vicki.Welch@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Nichols, Barbara J <Barbara.Nichols@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; MetroCall
<Metro.Call@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Sidewalk at 209 &211 Harpers Ferry Road

Hi Craig,
Please see attached photos of the sidewalk located in front of 209& 211 Harpers Ferry Rd. Ms. Cecilia May who resides
at 209 Harpers Ferry Rd tripped and fell on the sidewalk in front of her house; suffered some bumps and bruises. Was

hoping something could be done to repair them since there is work going on across the street. Would you please take a
look and give us an estimate? THANKS



Alexander, Elizabeth
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From: Alexander, Elizabeth
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 9:58 AM
To: Allen, Craig L
Cc: Welch, Vicki A; Nichols, Barbara J (Barbara.Nichols@louisvilleky.gov); MetroCall
Subject: Sidewalk at 209 &211 Harpers Ferry Road
Attachments: IMG_0345 jpg; IMG_0339.jpg; IMG_0340.jpg; IMG_0341.jpg; IMG_0342 jpg; IMG_

0343jpg; IMG_0344.jpg

Hi Craig,
Please see attached photos of the sidewalk located in front of 209& 211 Harpers Ferry Rd. Ms. Cecilia May who resides
at 209 Harpers Ferry Rd tripped and fell on the sidewalk in front of her house; suffered some bumps and bruises. Was

hoping something could be done to repair them since there is work going on across the street. Would you please take a
look and give us an estimate? THANKS












