Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander |

I Amount: $202.36 Date: January 14, 2019 l

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Economic Development for PARC to install parking t's along Kenilworth. Includes
installation of seven parking spaces. The old lines on the street have faded.

City Agency: Economic Development
Contact Person: Rebecca Fleischaker

Agency Phone: 502.574.2974

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

o [+ % W\ $202.36 ly ’S//ﬁ

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #;
Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHE:

Interagency Name: Economic Development

Program/Project Name: Parking t's on Kenilworth

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

| Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
 the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

'Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

- Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
~ estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
Yes -]
NA -]
NA B
. - -
Yes ]
Yes -]
NA
No
Yes

s ) A
[ 0
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Fleischaker, Rebecca

Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 3:42 PM

To: Robinson, Justin A

Cc: Bartley, Steven C.; Wall, Shawn M; Ethridge, Kyle
Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines

Well surel

From: Robinson, Justin A

Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 3:42 PM

To: Fleischaker, Rebecca

Cc: Bartley, Steven C.; Wall, Shawn M; Ethridge, Kyle
Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines

Rebecca,
Would you like Economic Development to accept the funding?
Thanks,

Justin

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 3:36 PM

To: Robinson, Justin A <jJustin.Robinson®@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bartley, Steven C. <Steven.Bartley@louisvilleky.gov>; Wall, Shawn M <Shawn.Wall@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking fines

Justin,

Will Louisville Forward/Economic Development accept $202.36 for the D9 office for PARC to install parking lines on
Kenilworth?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bili Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and
alerts!

From: Wall, Shawn M <Shawn.Wall@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 7:08 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bartley, Steven C. <Steven.Bartley@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Wall, Shawn M

Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 7:08 AM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Bartley, Steven C.

Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines
Follow Up Flag: _ Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Good Morning Kyle,

 was able to get out and take a look at this area and it looks like we would be able to put down 8 parking T’s that would
equal 7 spaces. The cost for the materials and labor are below.

Please let me know if this is something you guys would like to move forward with and | will try to get it scheduled
around the weather.

Thanks

Shawn
Kenilworth
Labor $132.36
Materials $70.00
Total $202.36

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Monday, December 31, 2018 10:38 AM
To: Wall, Shawn M

Cc: Bartley, Steven C.

Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines

Thanks, Shawn.

| spoke with Metro Public Works permits and there are no active permits for the area. The dashed lines we think we put
down by someone trying to show old parking line. There definitely used to be parking t's along that stretch.

I don’t think there are any bike lanes planned for this area due to narrow and dangerous road. No one has contacted our
office about bike lanes.

Hope this helps.

Thanks and Happy New Years Eve!
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109




Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and
alerts!

From: Wall, Shawn M <Shawn.Wall@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, December 31, 2018 10:27 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Bartley, Steven C. <Steven.Bartley@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Kenilworth - parking lines

Hi Kyle,

»

| will get someone out to take a look at this stretch of road for you. It looks like the markings on the ground may
possibly be for a bike lane. Would you happen to know if there is a planned bike lane on this stretch of road?

Shawn

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Friday, December 28, 2018 10:50 AM

To: Wall, Shawn M

Cc: Propes, Tiffany M; Taghizadeh, Mojgan; Howell, Gerald; Bartley, Steven C.
Subject: Kenilworth - parking lines

. Good Morning, Shawn.

We are first reaching out to PARC, since you help us with restriping needs in the District. A few years ago we completed a
new sidewalk project on Kenilworth from Brownsboro Road to the top of the hill. Included with that project was parking t's
on the right hand side of the road before the first house. Below are some recent photos, you can see some very faded
lines, as well as, a new dashed line that someone has created.

Can we work with PARC to get those parking t's repainted with thermal?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood news and
alerts!
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Ms. Kyle Ethridge




