Louisvillef’letro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

Print Form

| Primary Sponsor: _Councilwoman Donna Purvis ' ]

| Amount: $980.00 Date: 02/11/2019

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Alley light in the rear of 348 N 27th

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Jeffrey Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0085

I have reviewed this request—for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

5 OCWM 4 ﬁu Vs $980.00 2/11/19

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: A"ey ]lght install 348 N 27th St
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the CNA

funding source is probably NDF. |
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF, NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than o

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: \bﬂ/}ug(_ @2&4\,{ L%,

Date: aV// 1/19

Revised May 2016



Bentley, Denise G.

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Monday, February 11, 2019 8:07 AM

To: Bentley, Denise G.

Subject: RE: Alley Light

Attachments: 6306745_348N.27thContract - Metro only.doc

| got the contract today.
Public Works will accept $980 for the 5 year lease with LGE for the street light in the alley behind 348 N 27" st.
After the funds have been appropriated, | will signh the contract and return to LGE.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Bentley, Denise G. <Denise.Bentley@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, February 7, 2019 7:37 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Alley Light

Jeff-
Checking to see if everything is done so | can move forward with funding for the light at 348 N 27"

Denise Bentley
Legislative Assistant
Metro Council District 5
601 W Jefferson
Louisville, KY 40202
502-574-1105

57400V



Bentley, Denise G.

o ————
From: Cash, Cathy [Contractor] <Cathy.Cash@lge-ku.com>
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2019 2:05 PM
To: Bentley, Denise G.
Subject: LG&E Qutdoor Lighting - 348 N 27th St, 40212
Attachments: LG&E Lighting Brochure 2019.pdf; 348 N 27TH ST.pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Denise,

On 8/2/18, Kevin Vittitow at 348 N 27" St called and advised us that some lights were not working in the alley behind his
home and that people were dumping trash there.

We repaired the 4 Metro paid lights in the alley. Xevin wanted to have a light installed on the pole behind his house to
deter people from dumping trash. | told him he could have a light installed and pay for it after signing a five year
contract. He wanted the city to pay for a light. He contacted Sherry Hamilton’s office and Chase Sanders, her assistant,
called me to get info. | emailed him a Lighting Brochure on 9/11/18. Kevin called me on 9/13/18 and | told him | had
spoken with Chase and gave him Lighting info.

Kevin called me again on 10/25/18. | told him | had not heard anything from Chase. Kevin called again today, 1/18/19,
and said he was contacting your office to help get a light.

We have had some Metro Council people get lights for their areas. You would need to contact Jeffrey Brown with the
Public Works Department. His phone number is 502 574-0065. They require the Council Person to pay for the light for 5
years and allocate the money to the city. Jeffrey Brown would be the person to also confirm that Sherry Hamilton’s
office did not allocate money for a light to be placed at 348 N 27™ st.

| have attached a Lighting Brochure for you that shows the monthly rates and if you scroll down on the attachment you
can see pictures of the lights we offer. | have also attached a map showing the approximate locations of the lights in the
alley. The lights are highlighted in yellow and | have highlighted Kevin’s address.

Feel free to contact me if you need any additional information.

Cathy Cash

Coordinator | LG&E Outdoor Lighting Dept. | Ops Plus, Inc. (an official LG&E contractor)
6900 Enterprise Drive, Louisville, KY 40214

0: 502-364-8727 | F: 502-217-4765

lge-ku.com

The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the
person or entity to which it is directly addressed or copied. It may contain material of confidential and/or private
nature. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this
information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is not allowed. If you received this message
and the information contained therein by error, please contact the sender and delete the material from your/any
storage medium.




