Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
# Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Kevin Kramer |

| Amount: $1,850.00 Date: February 8, 2019 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

To repair broken sidewalks at 2824 Six Mile Lane under Service Request # 5151276-LMPWI.

City Agency: Crai 3 /:”lé"\ ; Erﬁ kgl | ) LGUA‘SU("HQ mé\ro"(%yzc (/()dh
Contact Person: ‘Né/ gé}u“ﬁ S'ﬂz g’"‘ﬂef\?j L/FL SI:IOOQ
Agency Phone: 7[_’_6' S"O’

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

11 /(Q //é(mw $1,850.00 Feb 8, 2019

District # Council Méfiber Signature Amount Date
Approved by: ‘
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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’I‘nteragency Name: Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: 2019 Sidewalk Repair/District 11

S s A e } L Ves/NG/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes

-
Submitted by: <C@;[// ZL) ‘HC{/)/UVM A Date: Feb 8,2019

Revised May 2016



Harrington, Scott ’

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, February 8, 2019 4:11 PM
To: Harrington, Scott

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Sorry, yes that is a typo the estimate is for 2824 Six Mile Ln. The repair lengths totaled 35.5 ft by 4 ft.

Craig Allen, E.L.T.

Engineer|

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
(502) 574 6159

From: Harrington, Scott <Scott.Harrington@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, February 8, 2019 3:25 PM

To: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@Iiouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Estimate

Craig,

Yes... that is MSD doing work around Manner Dale so they’ll replace that section of sidewalk along with the headwall in
one drainage project.

What is the length of sidewalk needing replaced at 2824 Six Mile Lane under SR# 5151276-LMPWI? Also, in your email
below you have the address as 2524 Six Mile Lane. That may be a typo but want to avoid confusion later on that the
correct address is 2824 Six Mile Lane.

Thank you!

Scott

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street
email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

,Srgn up for District 11’s E-Newsletter

Tharnk you for the opportunity to servel



I also wanted to let you know 4301 Manner Dale Dr has been under construction. Not by PW’s, | think it’s MSD. I'm not
sure if they are done yet but | just wanted to put you on notice.

Thanks and have a good weekend,

Craig Allen, E.LT.

Engineer|

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
444 South 5" Street, 4™ Floor
Louisville KY 40202

(502)574-6159



Helton, Jessamxn

T e i u— e ————
From: Harrington, Scott
Sent: Thursday, February 21, 2019 9:32 AM
To: Allen, Craig L; Bell, LaTonya J.; Kramer, Kevin
Cc: Stenberg, Beth; MetroCouncilClerk
Subject: RE: D11 - 2/27/19 Appropriations Comments - CIF022719PW 11

Thanks Craig.
Jess —would you please add to my documentation?
Thank you!

Scott

Scott W. Harrington | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
Louisville Metro Council | District 11

phone: 502.574.3456 City Hall
fax: 502.574.4501 601 West Jefferson Street
email: scott.harrington@louisvilleky.gov Louisville, Kentucky 40202

%Sugn up for District 11’s E-Newsletter

From: Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen®@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 21, 2019 8:15 AM

To: Harrington, Scott <Scott.Harrington@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Kramer,
Kevin <Kevin.Kramer@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; MetroCouncilClerk <MetroCouncilClerk@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D11 - 2/27/19 Appropriations Comments - CIF022719PW11

Good morning Everyone!

Please see the repair costs below.

LOCATION 2824 Six Mle Ln

REQUESTED BY Dist 11

RATE 5




DATE SENT 2/21/2019
ESTIMATE BY CA
16 SY of sw and 16 SY of seed and
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT . $1,847.73
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

Thanks,

Craig Allen, E.L.T.

Engineer|

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
(502) 574 6159

From: Harrington, Scott <Scott.Harrington@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 21, 2019 7:37 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>; Kramer, Kevin <Kevin.Kramer@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L
<Craig. Allen@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; MetroCouncilClerk <MetroCouncilClerk@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: D11 - 2/27/19 Appropriations Comments - CIF022719PW11

LaTonya - the quote was in the email from Craig Allen.

Craig - would you please email us a copy of the repair costs?

Thank you!

Scott Harrington
Legislative Assistant to
Councilman Kevin J. Kramer
601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202

502-574-1111



From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 4:38 PM

To: Harrington, Scott; Kramer, Kevin

Cc: Stenberg, Beth; MetroCouncilClerk

Subject: D11 - 2/27/19 Appropriations Comments - CIF022719PW11

Good evening,

Please provide the Clerk’s office with the $1,850 sidewalk repair quote as soon as possible. Thanks.

5. CIF022719P APPROPRIATING $1,850 FROM DISTRICT 11 CAPITAL

wii INFRASTRUCTURE FUNDS TO PUBLIC WORKS TO REPAIR
BROKEN SIDEWALKS AT 2824 SIX MILE LANE.

Sponsors: Primary Kevin Kramer (R-11)

Attachments: D11 CIF 1850 LMPWA Broken Sidewalk 2824 Six Mile Lane.pdf

Comments: Missing the Service Request #5151276-LMPWI reflecting the $1,850
sidewalk repair quote.

LaTonya J. Bell | Council Financial Analyst

Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street, 20 floor | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1351
LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov




