Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

Print Form j

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

| Amount: $3,205.79 Date: 2-21-19

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funds are being requested to purchase (4) cameras to be installed in highly illegal dumping areas
in District 14 and 25. The cameras will be monitored by Solid Waste Management Services, will be
attached in inconspicuous locations and moved when needed. The cameras will have the
capability for SWMS to zoom in to read license plates.

City Agency: Solid Waste Management Services
Contact Person: Robert Lush, Jr.

Agency Phone: 502-574-8455

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
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Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Department/Project:
Solid Waste Management Services/Camera's for lllegal dumping areas

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Solid Waste Management Services

Program/Project Name: Cameras for lllegal Dumping Areas
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: m %%@Mm ) Date: o4/

Revised May 2016



Thieneman, Cindy L

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

All,

Lush, Robert P. Jr.

Friday, February 15, 2019 12:28 PM

Fowler, Cindi; Yates, David

Boles, Brian; Thieneman, Cindy L; Flood, Pete C.; Hackett, Keith
Camera Quotes

165355_Louisville_Metro_Public.pdf

| received the quote today for the cameras that we discussed for illegal dumping. The quote is for two cameras each and
all accessories. The cost would be $1602.90 per District. Here is the link for the cameras we recommend:
http://www.reconyx.com/product/ultrafire-professional-covert-camera

When we talked last, we looked at possibly getting a camera that would allow us to utilize cellular if we wanted to
activate it in the future. However, this camera does not have that option. It is strictly without cellular, but it has other
qualities that we believe make it a better choice. The megapixel is better on these cameras which would allow us to
zoom in on the images a bit better in hopes of reading a license plate on a vehicle that may be far from the camera. The
nighttime infrared is also a bit better, and while it is not likely we would use it often they also allow for videos to be
recorded instead of images alone. That could be beneficial in some areas.

Please let me know if you have any further questions or if you would like to move forward with the camera purchase.

Robert Lush

Compliance and Enforcement Supervisor
Department for Public Works
Solid Waste Management Services

600 Meriwether Avenue
Louisville, KY 40217
Office: 502-574-8455



Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Bradley, Maxwell B.

Sent: Monday, February 18, 2019 3:43 PM

To: Lush, Robert P. Jr; Fowler, Cindi; Boles, Brian

Cc: Yates, David; Thieneman, Cindy L; Flood, Pete C.; Hackett, Keith
Subject: RE: Camera Quotes

Hello Robert,

This type of project would require Metro Council appropriate the funding to SWMS. We would then have work
completed and pay the contractor/supplies.

Thanks,
MB

From: Lush, Robert P. Ir. <Robert.Lush@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 18, 2019 12:37 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>; Boles, Brian <Brian.Boles@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Bradley, Maxwell B.
<Maxwell.Bradley@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Yates, David <David.Yates@louisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Flood, Pete
C. <Pete.Flood@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hackett, Keith <Keith.Hackett@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Camera Quotes

Max,

Councilwoman Fowler and Councilman Yates are looking to purchase surveillance cameras. I've received this quote for
the cameras. How do we go about transferring the funds from the Council Offices over so that we can purchase the
cameras?

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Friday, February 15, 2019 1:43 PM

To: Boles, Brian

Cc: Lush, Robert P. Jr.; Yates, David; Thieneman, Cindy L; Flood, Pete C.; Hackett, Keith
Subject: Re: Camera Quotes

Robert,
Thank you for getting this together. [ am in full agreement and can get the paperwork together for the
transfer. Thanks again! Cindi

Sent from my iPad

On Feb 15, 2019, at 1:03 PM, Boles, Brian <Brian.Boles@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Thank you Robert. We are supportive and willing to fund.

Thank you,

Brian Boles



RECONYX, INC

3828 Creekside Lane
Holmen, WI 54636

Voice: 608-781-6064

Fax:  608-779-1344
February 15, 2019
Quote #: 165355
Bill To: Ship To:
Louisville Metro Public Works Louisville Metro Public Works
ATTN: BEN TIPTON ATTN: ROBERT LUSH
611 W JEFFERSON ST 600 MERTWETHER AVE
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202-2714 LOUISVILLE METRO SOLID WASTE
P: 502-574-8455 LOUISVILLE, KY 40217-1146
robert.lush@louisvilleky.gov P: 502-574-8455

robert.lush@louisvilleky.gov

Qty Sku Description Of Item Price Discount | Net Price | Ext Price
4 | XP9 UltraFire Professional Covert Camera Trap 699.99 35.00 664.99 2,659.96
4 |AACHGR |NiMH AA Battery Charger 39.99 2.00 37.99 151.96
4 |32GBSD 32GB Reconyx Certified SDHC Memory Card 19.99 1.00 18.99 75.96
4 | THUNDBLT | ThunderBolt - Professional Mounting Block 29.99 1.50 28.49 113.96
4 |UFSE UltraFire Camera Series Security Enclosure 49.99 2.50 47.49 189.96
* All prices are in USD. Subtotal S
* This quote is valid for 90 days from date of issue and subject to product availability. Shipping & Handling e
* Payment terms are either prepayment via wire transfer or Net 30 days from date of Tax 0.00
invoice with pre-approved credit. For additional payment options, please call. Total 3,205.79

* Ships via UPS Ground.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please call me at 608-781-6064 or send me an email at

orders@reconyx.com.

Sincerely,
Justin Thiner

RECONYX, Inc. Quote#: 165355
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Thieneman, Cindy L

From: Lush, Robert P. Jr.

Sent: Wednesday, February 20, 2019 2;56 PM

To: Thieneman, Cindy L

Cc: Fowler, Cindi; Yates, David; Boles, Brian; Bradley, Maxwell B.; Hackett, Keith; Sullivan,
Kimberly L

Subject: RE: Camera Quotes

Good afternoon,

Yes, we will accept the funds of $3,205.79 for four surveillance cameras.

Robert Lush

Compliance and Enforcement Supervisor
Department for Public Works

Solid Waste Management Services

600 Meriwether Avenue

Louisville, KY 40217
Office: 502-574-8455

From: Thieneman, Cindy L

Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 11:28 AM
To: Lush, Robert P. Jr.

Cc: Fowler, Cindi; Yates, David; Boles, Brian
Subject: RE: Camera Quotes

Hello Mr. Lush,
Will you/your agency except the funds of $3,205.79 for (4) surveillance cameras. These cameras will be used equally by
District 14 and 25 and sharing the cost of $1,602.90 each. Thank you

Cindy Thieneman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p:502.574.1114 City Hall

e: cindy.thieneman@louisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

From: Lush, Robert P. Jr. <Robert.Lush@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 18, 2019 12:37 PM

To: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Boles, Brian <Brian.Boles@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Bradley, Maxwell B.
<Maxwell.Bradley@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Yates, David <David.Yates@louisvilleky.gov>; Thieneman, Cindy L <Cindy.Thieneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Flood, Pete
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